REPUBLIC OF KENYA
THE NATIONAL ASSEMBLY

TWELFTH PARLIAMENT (FIFTH SESSION)

DEPARTMENTAL COMMITTEE ON HEALTH

------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------

REPORT ON-
THE HEALTH (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2021, (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 14 OF 2021)

WA £
H’Uv . -X N CWSV i
B PN WY v HAU“ e

CLERKS CHAMBERS T N <w i
DIRECTORATE OF DEPARTMENTAL COMMITTEES
PARLIAMENT BUILDINGS

NAIROBI AUGUST 2021







L]

TABLE OF CONTENTS

CEAIR PERBOINS FORIE WOTRID coucosussnimasussnsssossossesssoesssmessssis52s5a5 s 5085505445588 504 5 S inmnins 3
PART Lottt sttt b e s et s st e bbb en s e s s s anens 4
I PREFACGE ...ttt 4
1.1 ESTABLISHMENT OF THE COMMITTEE.......ccococsisinninirisiriiiieessesessssie et 4

1.2 COMMITTEE SUBJECTS ......ooioioirieieieeieieitninintsstseseesestssese st se e sas st sssss s senns 5

1.3 COMMITTEE MEMBERSHIP .......cccoivivtitititieieiniriniersietstsisssssssss s ssssess e ss et 6
LACONMMITIEE BECRETARTAT oo s s M s st msmmmsmssasmmans 7
PR Ll vevsmonsonensnusmes s onnsessonswnsscsss esas o a8 500546595494 684 it mans o ok s e s aemaa s sSSP PRSI A  EORPRS 8
2.0 OVERVIEW OF THE HEALTH LAW (AMENDMENT) BILL, NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL
INCY, B OUF 2T ;ox ywivnnsivssnmsnans s usmssss s 58080555564 435555.50 s sess st s e men smamswmmmsm meve o ms RN SR RO T 8
21 ANALYSIS OF LHE BILL coususamessssmmsnssissn st isans o ansimisimmmmmnsmon ssass sy 8
PR TLL covonserumevnroneessnesnsosonmsssnnetssmons s nnsissss s 5aioss o455 655 hosnns smesn sasmsmssm et ons eesssssras ams wvsm ssesmpes s sy sy s g sores 9
3.0 PUBLIC PARTICIPATION/STAKEHOLDER CONSULTATION ......cooovvemuiuereeereeerieeeeeeeeeeeenns 9
PART IV ottt bbbttt st s st e s tes et saeses 10
4.0 COMMITTEE RECOMMENDATION......ccccecsiririnriirireneirisissiesessssesesesessssesssesssssssssssessssssssssses 10
PART W sxenssnsnsnnsssmsssrnisans sosnsins sonesos ss5556ssi s iasn annananssnsns somsasorios oosa s woss'se swy o ao s oo s 6 K ess Qo maan s muss s 11
5.0 SCHEDULE OF PROPOSED AMENDMENTS ......c.ceeviitriiieeretieeceete et 11

Page |2






CHAIRPERSON’S FOREWORD

Article 118(1) (b) of the Constitution provides that, "Parliament shall facilitate public
participation and involvement in the legislative and other business of Parliament and its
Committees". Standing Order 127 (3) provides that "the Departmental Committee to which a Bill
is committed shall facilitate public participation and take into account the views and
recommendations of the public when the Committee makes its report to the House".

The Health (Amendment) Bill, (National Assembly Bill No. 14 of 2021) introduced by Hon.
Moses Mwambu Wekesa Mabonga, MP underwent First Reading on 9" June, 2021 and was
committed to the Departmental Committee on Health for consideration and reporting to the

House.

This report contains the deliberations on the Bill. Most importantly, the Bill seeks to amend the
Health Act No 21 of 2017 to provide that the National government and County governments
shall, in consultation through the existing inter-governmental relations mechanism establish
regional cancer centers; to make it an offence for a person in-charge of a Public Health facility to
demand or permit payment of advance medical fees as pre-condition for the provision of medical
services; to make it an offence for person in charge of a Public Health facility to detain a body of
a deceased person as means of enforcing settlement of outstanding medical bills and to provide
for regulation on levying of charges for the practice of conventional medical practice.

Following placement of advertisements in the print media on 11™ June, 2021 requesting for
comments on the Bill from members of the public and relevant stakeholders pursuant to the
provisions of Article 118(1)(b) of the Constitution of Kenya and Standing Order 127(3), the
Committee received memoranda from only one (1) stakeholder i.e. the Ministry of Health. The
public participation meeting was held virtually on 13™ July, 2021.

On behalf of the Departmental Committee on Health and pursuant to the provisions of Standing
Order 199 (6), it is my pleasant privilege and honour to present to this House the Report of the
Committee on its consideration of the Health (Amendment) Bill, (National Assembly Bill No. 14
of 2021). The Committee is grateful to the Offices of the Speaker and the Clerk of the National
Assembly for the logistical and technical support accorded to it during its sittings. The
Committee further wishes to thank the Ministry of Health for submitting their comments on the
Bill. Finally, I wish to express my appreciation to the Honourable Members of the Committee
and the Committee Secretariat who played significant role in preparation and production of this

report.

It is my pleasure to report that the Committee has considered the Health (Amendment) Bill,
(National Assembly Bill No. 14 of 202I) and have the honour to table in the House the
Committee’s report on the Bill with recommendation that the House passes it with amendments

as proposed.

Hon. Sabina Chege, MP
Chairperson, Departmental Committee on Health

Page | 3






PART I

1 PREFACE

1.1 ESTABLISHMENT OF THE COMMITTEE

L.

The Departmental Committee on Health is established pursuant to the provisions of Standing
Order No. 216 of the National Assembly and in line with Article 124 of the Constitution
which provides for the establishment of the Committees by Parliament. The mandate and
functions of the Committee are;

a)

b)

Investigate, inquire into, and report on all matters relating to the mandate,
management, activities, administration, operations and estimates of the assigned

Ministries and departments;

Study the programme and policy objectives of the Ministries and departments and

the effectiveness of the implementation;
Study and review all legislation referred to it;

Study, assess and analyze the relative success of the Ministries and departments

as measured by the results obtained as compared with its stated objectives;

Investigate and inquire into all matters relating to the assigned Ministries and
departments as they may deem necessary, and as may be referred to them by the

House,

Vet and report on all appointments where the constitution or any law requires the

National Assembly to approve, except those under Standing Order 204,

Ja) Examine treaties, agreements and conventions;

g

h)

i)

Make reports and recommendations to the House as often as possible, including

recommendation of proposed legislation,

Consider reports of Commissions and Independent Offices submitted to the House

pursuant to the provisions of Article 254 of the Constitution, and

Examine any questions raised by Members on a matter within its mandate

Page | 4



N

o~



1.2 COMMITTEE SUBJECTS
2. The Second Schedule of the Standing Orders on Departmental Committees outlines the

Subjects of the Committee’s mandate as health, medical care and health insurance.

3. In executing its mandate, the Committee oversights the Ministry of Health, its Semi-
Autonomous Government Agencies, Regulatory Bodies and Health Advisory Bodies as
follows:

—

© P Ny s W

—
(=]

11.
12.
13.
14.

Kenyatta National Hospital (KNH)

Moi Teaching and Referral Hospital (MTRH)

Kenyatta University Teaching Referral and Research Hospital (KUTRRH)
Kenya Medical Training College (KMTC)

Kenya Medical Supplies Authority (KEMSA)

Kenya Medical Research Institute (KEMRI)

National Hospital Insurance Fund (NHIF)

Pharmacy and Poisons Board (PPB)

National AIDS Control Council (NACC)

. National Cancer Institute (NCI)

Kenya Nuclear Regulatory Authority (KENRA)

The Mathari National Teaching and Referral Hospital (MNTRH)
Kenya Health Professionals Oversight Authority (KHPOA)
Kenya Health Human Resource Advisory Council (KHHRAC)

Page | 5



ks




1.3 COMMITTEE MEMBERSHIP

4. The Departmental Committee on Health was re-constituted by the House in July, 2020 and

comprises of the following Members:

Hon. Sabina Chege, MP (Chairperson)

Hon. (Dr.) Eseli Simiyu, MP
Tongaren Constituency
Ford Kenya Party

Hon. Gideon Ochanda, MP
Bondo Constituency

ODM Party

Hon. (Dr.) James Nyikal, MP
Seme Constituency

ODM Party

Hon. Alfred Agoi Masadia, MP
Sabatia Constituency

ANC Party

Hon. (Dr.) James K, Murgor, MP
Keiyo North Constituency

Jubilee Party

Hon. Muriuki Njagagua, MP
Mbeere North Constituency
Jubilee Party

Hon. (Dr.) Mohamed D. Duale, MP

Daadab Constituency
KANU Party

Hon. Beatrice Adagala, MP
Vihiga County
ANC Party

Hon. James G Wamacukuru
Kabete Constituency

Jubilee Party

Muranga County
Jubilee Party

Vice-Chairperson
Hon. Joshua Kutuny, MP
Cherengan’y Constituency

Jubilee Par

Hon. Prof. Mohamud Sheikh, MP
Wajir South

Jubilee Party

Hon. Sarah Puleta Korere, MP
Laikipia North Constituency

Jubilee Par

Hon.Capt. Ruweida Mohamed, MP
Lamu County

Jubilee Party

Hon. Kipsengeret Koros, MP
Sigowet-Soin Constituency
Independent Party

Hon. Martin Peters Owino, MP
Ndhiwa Constituency

ODM Par

Hon. Joyce Ekai Emanikor, MP
Turkana County

Jubilee Party

Hon. Said Hirabe, MP
Galole Constituency
Ford Kenya Party

Hon. Tongoyo Gabriel Koshal, MP
Narok West Constituency

CCM Par

Page | 6






1.4 COMMITTEE SECRETARIAT
1. The Committee is serviced by the following Secretariat staff:

Head of the Secretariat
Mr. Douglas Katho
Clerk Assistant II

Ms. Christine Odhiambo
Legal Counsel I

Mr. Muyodi Meldaki Emmanuel
Clerk Assistant II

Mr. Eric Kanyi
Fiscal Analyst IT

Ms. Fiona Musili
Research Officer IT

Mr. Ahmed Yakub
Media Relations Officer

Ms. Catherine Wangui
Serjeant-At-Arms

Mr. Nimrod Ochieng
Audio Officer

Page | 7






PART II

2.0 OVERVIEW OF THE HEALTH (AMENDMENT) BILL, NATIONAL ASSEMBLY

BILL NO. 14 OF 2021

2.1 ANALYSIS OF THE BILL

5.

8.

9.

The Bill seeks to amend the Health Act No 21 of 2017 to provide that the National
government and County governments shall, in consultation through the existing inter-
governmental relations mechanism establish regional cancer centers;

The Bill also seeks to amend the principal Act to make it an offence for a person in-charge of
a Public Health facility to demand or permit payment of advance medical fees as pre-
condition for the provision of medical services;

The Bill also seeks to make it an offence for person in charge of a Public Health facility to
detain a body of a deceased person as means of enforcing settlement of outstanding medical
bills and to provide for regulation on levying of charges for the practice of conventional
medical practice.

Proposed amendment

New subsection (5)—
“(5) The national government and county governments shall, in consultation through the
existing inter-governmental relations mechanisms, establish regional cancer centres.”

New subsections (4) and (5)

(4) A person in charge of a public health facility commits an offence, if the person demands or
permits the demand of payment of advance medical fees or admission fees prior to treating or
admitting a patient as the case may be, and is liable on conviction to a fine not exceeding
three million shillings or to imprisonment for a term of three months, or to both.

(5) A person in charge of a public health facility commits an offence, if the person detains or
permits the detention of the body of a deceased person for purposes of enforcing settlement of
pending bills and, is liable on conviction to a fine not exceeding two million shillings or to
imprisonment for a term of three months or to both.

10. New paragraph after paragraph (d)—

“(da) levying of charges on the practice of conventional medicine in consultation with
relevant statutory bodies and stakeholders.”

Page | 8






PART III

3.0 PUBLIC PARTICIPATION/STAKEHOLDER CONSULTATION

11.

12.

Following placement of advertisements in the print media on 11" June, 2021 seeking views
on the Bill from members of the public and relevant stakeholders pursuant to Article
118(1)(b) of the Constitution of Kenya and Standing Order 127(3), the Committee received a
memorandum from the Ministry of Health. The meeting was held virtually on 13™ July,
2021.

MINISTRY OF HEALTH

CLAUSE 3
The Ministry of Health proposed an amendment to the proposed new subsections (4) and (5)

as follows—

(4) A person in charge of a health facility commits an offence, if the person demands or
permits the demand of payment of advance medical fees or admission fees prior to providing
emergency medical care, and is liable on conviction to a fine not exceeding three million
shillings or to imprisonment for a term of three months, or to both.

(5) A person in charge of a health facility commits an offence, if the person detains or
permits the detention of the body of a deceased person for purposes of enforcing settlement
of pending bills and is liable on conviction to a fine not exceeding two million shillings or to
imprisonment for a term of three months or both.

Justification

i. Emergency medical care should be provided in both public and private health facilities as
provided in subsection (3) of the Health Act.

ii. The requirement not to detain dead bodies in health facilities due to non-payment of
hospital bills should apply to both public and private facilities.

Page | 9






PART IV

4.0 COMMITTEE RECOMMENDATION
13. The Committee having considered the Health (Amendment) Bill, National Assembly Bill

No. 14 of 2021 recommends that the House approve the Bill with amendments as proposed
in the schedule.

Page | 10



L




PARTV

5.0 SCHEDULE OF PROPOSED AMENDMENTS
14. The Committees proposed the following amendments to be considered by the House in the

Committee stage:

CLAUSE 3
15. THAT, clause 3 of the Bill be amended—
(a) in the proposed new subsection (4), by deleting the words “three months” and
substituting therefor the words “two years”; and

(b) in the proposed new subsection (5), by deleting the words “three months” and
substituting therefor the words “one year”.

Justification

The amendment seeks to ensure that the term of imprisonment to be imposed for the offences of
demanding advance payment before emergency medical treatment, and for detaining dead bodies
in public health facilities, shall be proportional to the amount of monetary fine that may be
imposed.

SIGNED. bz B 45 et e s e DATE.... T{%h“’ ....................

CHAIRPERSON,
DEPARTMENTAL COMMITTEE ON HEALTH

Page | 11






THE NATIONAL ASSEMBLY
DEPARTMENTAL COMMITTEE ON HEALTH
ATTENDANCE SCHEDULE

ADOPTION SCHEDULE FOR THE CONSIDERATION OF THE REPORT ON THE HEALTH (AMENDMENT)
BILL, 2021, NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 14 OF 2021

NAME

SIGNATURE

Hon. Sabina Chege, MP — Chairperson

=
L F i

2. | Hon. Joshua Kutuny, MP — Vice-Chairperson Z
3. | Hon. Dr. Eseli Simiyu, MP — U
4. | Hon. Dr. James Nyikal, MP
5. | Hon. Dr. Mohamed Dahir Duale, MP ‘[mi 2 )
6. | Hon. Dr. James Kipkosgei Murgor, MP {j\_f}
7. | Hon. Alfred Agoi Masadia, MP
8. | Hon. Muriuki Njagagua, MP Vi (&\/w\,.(,
9. | Hon. Joyce Akai Emanikor, MP NG @rbux,b .
10. | Hon. Prof. Mohamud Sheikh Mohamed, MP R \J‘WQ/ /‘f/ﬁ;@’/
11.| Hon. Martin Peters Owino, MP \J/ ma
M s
12.| Hon. Kipsengeret Koros, MP
13.| Hon. Tongoyo Gabriel Koshal, MP
14.| Hon. Sarah Paulata Korere, MP
15.| Hon. Dr. Gideon Ochanda, MP //im -
16.| Hon. Beatrice Adagala, MP &:A A
17.| Hon. Said Hiribae, MP - O
18.| Hon. (Capt.) Ruweida Mohammed, MP Ww §
19.| Hon. James Githua Kamau Wamacukuru, MP \M -







MINUTES OF THE FORTY-FIRST (41°T) SITTING OF THE DEPARTMENTAL
COMMITTEE ON HEALTH HELD ON TUESDAY 3®° AUGUST, 2021 VIA ZOOM
AT 10.00 A.M.

PRESENT

The Hon. Sabina Chege, MP - Chairperson
The Hon. Joshua Kutuny, MP — Vice-Chairperson
The Hon. Dr James Kipkosgei Murgor, MP

The Hon. Dr Mohamed Dahir Duale, MP

The Hon. Prof Mohamud Sheikh Mohamed, MP

The Hon. Muriuki Njagagua, MP

The Hon. Joyce Akai Emanikor, MP

The Hon. Martin Peters Owino, MP

. The Hon. Dr Gideon Ochanda, MP

10. The Hon. Kipsengeret Koros, MP

11. The Hon. (Capt) Ruweida Mohammed, MP

12. The Hon. Beatrice Adagala, MP

PNV AW

ABSENT WITH APOLOGY
1. The Hon. Dr James Nyikal, MP
The Hon. Dr Eseli Simiyu, MP
The Hon. Alfred Agoi Masadia, MP
The Hon James Githua Kamau Wamacukuru, MP
The Hon. Tongoyo Gabriel Koshal, MP
The Hon. Said Hiribae, MP
The Hon. Sarah Paulata Korere, MP

NovawD

IN ATTENDANCE
NATIONAL ASSEMBLY SECRETARIAT

1. Douglas Katho — Clerk Assistant II
2. Christine Odhiambo - Legal Counsel I
3. Muyodi Emmanuel - Clerk Assistant II
4. Nimrod Ochieng - Audio Officer

MIN. NO.NA/DC.H/2021/136: PRELIMINARIES
The Vice-Chairperson called the meeting to order at 10.15 a.m. and said a prayer.

MIN.NO.NA/DC.H/2021/137: ADOPTION OF THE REPORTS ON BILLS
The Committee considered the proposed amendments and adopted the reports as follows:

1. THE NATIONAL HOSPITAL INSURANCE FUND (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2021
(NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 21 OF 2021)

The agenda was deferred to Wednesday 4™ August, 2021 at 9.00 p.m.



2. THE COMMUNITY HEALTH WORKERS BILL, 2020, (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY
BILL NO. 30 OF 2020)

The Committee adopted the report on the Community Health Workers Bill, 2020 (National
Assembly Bill No. 30 of 2020) after being proposed by the Hon. Beatrice Adagala, MP
and seconded by the Hon. (Capt) Ruweida Mohammed, MP. ( The Committee’s proposed
amendments are detailed in Part V of the report).

3. THE RADIOGRAPHERS BILL 2019, (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 47 OF
2019)

The Committee adopted the report on the Radiographers Bill, 2019 (National Assembly
Bill No. 47 of 2019) after being proposed by the Hon. Joyce Akai Emanikor, MP and
seconded by the Hon. (Capt) Ruweida Mohammed, MP. (The Committee’s proposed
amendments are detailed in Part V of the report).

4. THE HEALTH (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2021, (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO.
14 OF 2021)

The Committee adopted the report on the Health (Amendment) Bill, 2021 (National
Assembly Bill No. 14 of 2021) after being been proposed by the Hon. (Capt) Ruweida
Mohammed, MP and seconded by the Hon. Kipsengeret Koros, MP. (The Committee’s
proposed amendments are detailed in Part V of the report).

5. THE PHARMACY AND POISONS (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2021 (NATIONAL
ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 1 OF 2021)

The Committee adopted the report on the Pharmacy and Poisons (Amendment) Bill, 2021
(National Assembly Bill No. 1 of 2021) after being proposed by the Hon. Joyce Akai
Emanikor, MP and seconded by the Hon. (Capt) Ruweida Mohammed, MP. (The
Committee’s proposed amendments are detailed in Part V of the report).

MIN. NO.NA/DC.H/2021/138: ADJOURNMENT
There being no further business, the meeting was adjourned at 12.44 p.m.

HON. SABINA CHEGE, MP
(CHAIRPERSON)

----------------------



MINUTES OF THE THIRTY- SEVENTH (37™) SITTING OF THE
DEPARTMENTAL COMMITTEE ON HEALTH HELD ON MONDAY 26™ JULY,
2021 AT ENGLISH POINT, MARINA — MOMBASA IN MEDUSA 2 CONFERENCE
ROOM AT 2.30 P.M

PRESENT
1. The Hon. Sabina Chege, MP - Chairperson
2. The Hon. Joshua Kutuny, MP — Vice-Chairperson
3. The Hon. Dr James Nyikal, MP
4. The Hon. Dr James Kipkosgei Murgor, MP
5. The Hon. Dr Mohamed Dahir Duale, MP
6. The Hon. Prof Mohamud Sheikh Mohamed, MP
7. The Hon. Muriuki Njagagua, MP
8. The Hon. Dr Gideon Ochanda, MP

9. The Hon. Martin Peters Owino, MP

10. The Hon. (Capt) Ruweida Mohammed, MP

11. The Hon. Kipsengeret Koros, MP

12. The Hon. Beatrice Adagala, MP

13. The Hon James Githua Kamau Wamacukuru, MP

ABSENT WITH APOLOGY

1. The Hon. Dr Eseli Simiyu, MP
The Hon. Joyce Akai Emanikor, MP
The Hon. Alfred Agoi Masadia, MP
The Hon. Tongoyo Gabriel Koshal, MP
The Hon. Said Hiribae, MP
The Hon. Sarah Paulata Korere, MP

S EW

IN ATTENDANCE
NATIONAL ASSEMBLY SECRETARIAT

1. Benjamin Magut - Senior Clerk Assistant
2. Douglas Katho - Clerk Assistant II

3. Christine Odhiambo - Legal Counsel I

4. Muyodi Emmanuel — Clerk Assistant II

5. Nimrod Ochieng - Audio Officer

MIN. NO.NA/DC.H/2021/121: PRELIMINARIES
The Vice-Chairperson called the meeting to order at 2.45 p.m. and said a prayer. Thereafter
he welcomed the Committee Members.

MIN.NO.NA/DC.H/2021/122: CLAUSE BY CLAUSE CONSIDERATION OF
THE HEALTH (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2021,
(NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 14 OF 2021)



After clause by clause deliberations, the Committees proposed amendments to the Health
(Amendment) Bill, (National Assembly Bill No. 14 of 2021) as follows:

CLAUSE 3
THAT, clause 3 of the Bill be amended—

(a) in the proposed new subsection (4), by deleting the words “three months” and
substituting therefor the words “two years”; and

(b) in the proposed new subsection (5), by deleting the words “three months” and
substituting therefor the words “one year”.

Justification

The amendment seeks to ensure that the term of imprisonment to be imposed for the offences
of demanding advance payment before emergency medical treatment, and for detaining dead
bodies in public health facilities, shall be proportional to the amount of monetary fine that
may be imposed.

MIN. NO.NA/DC.H/2021/123: ADJOURNMENT/DATE OF NEXT MEETING

There being no further business, the meeting was adjourned at 3.16 p.m.

HON. SABINA CHEGE, MP
(CHAIRPERSON)




W

b B

MINUTES OF THE THIRTY-FIRST (31°") SITTING OF THE DEPARTMENTAL
COMMITTEE ON HEALTH HELD ON TUESDAY 13™ JULY, 2021 VIA ZOOM AT

10.00 AM

PRESENT

The Hon. Joshua Kutuny, MP — Vice-Chairperson
The Hon. Dr James Nyikal, MP

The Hon. Dr James Kipkosgei Murgor, MP

The Hon. Muriuki Njagagua, MP

The Hon. Martin Peters Owino, MP

The Hon. Kipsengeret Koros, MP

The Hon. Beatrice Adagala, MP

The Hon. (Capt) Ruweida Mohammed, MP

NS YA L

ABSENT WITH APOLOGY

The Hon. Sabina Chege, MP - Chairperson
The Hon. Dr Eseli Simiyu, MP

Dr. Dahir Duale, MP

The Hon. Dr Gideon Ochanda, MP

The Hon. Prof Mohamud Sheikh Mohamed, MP
The Hon. Joyce Akai Emanikor, MP

The Hon. Alfred Agoi Masadia, MP

The Hon. Tongoyo Gabriel Koshal, MP

. Hon James Githua Kamau Wamacukuru, MP
10. The Hon. Said Hiribae, MP

11. The Hon. Sarah Paulata Korere, MP

VO NG AW

IN ATTENDANCE
NATIONAL ASSEMBLY SECRETARIAT

1. Benjamin Magut - Senior Clerk Assistant

2. Douglas Katho - Clerk Assistant II

3. Christine Odhiambo - Legal Counsel I

4. Muyodi Emmanuel - Clerk Assistant II

5. Nimrod Ochieng - Audio Officer
STAKEHOLDERS

1. Dr. Patrick Amoth - Director General, Ministry of Health;

2. Kenya Pharmaceutical Association;

3. Pharmaceutical Society of Kenya;

4. Mr. Mwalimu Muthisya

5. Mr. Astone Ashioya.



MIN. NO.NA/DC.H/2021/106: PRELIMINARIES
The Vice-Chairperson called the meeting to order at 10.15 a.m. and said a prayer. Thereafter
he welcomed the Committee Members and the stakeholders.

MIN.NO.NA/DC.H/2021/107: STAKEHOLDERS ENGAGEMENT ON THE ON
THE HEALTH (AMENDMENT) BILL,
(NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO. 14 OF 2021)

Following placement of advertisements in the print media on 11™ June, 2021 seeking views

on the Bill from members of the public and relevant stakeholders pursuant to Article
118(1)(b) of the Constitution of Kenya and Standing Order 127(3), the Committee received a
memorandum from one stakeholder, i.e. the Ministry of Health. (details of their submissions
and import of each proposed amendment are contained in Part III of the report on the
Health (Amendment) Bill, (National Assembly No. 14 of 2021).

MIN. NO.NA/DC.H/2021/108: ADJOURNMENT

There being no further business, the meeting was adjourned at 12.57 p.m.

HON. SABINA CHEGE, MP
(CHAIRPERSON)




DAILY NATION FRIDAY, JUNE 11,2021

THE NATIONAL ASSEMBLY

TWELFTH PARLIAMENT- FIFTH SESSION

~ In the Matter of Article 118(1) (b) of the chstitufion
~ And
- In the Matter of Consideration by the National Assembly of;

13 The Higher Education Loans Board (_Amendment) Bill, 2020 (National Assembly Bill No. 37 of 2020);
2. The Pharmacy and Poi (A dment) Bill (N ional A bly Bill No. 1 of 2021);
3. The Health (A di t) Bill (Nati 1A bly Bill No. 14 of 2021); ]
S ; 4.~ The National Electronic Single Window System Bill, 2021 (National Assembly Bill No. 15 of 2021);
i Gy 5. The Coffee Bill, 2021 (National Assembly Bill No. 17 of 2021); :
2 ; 6. The Community Groups Registration Bill (National Assembly Bill No. 20 of 2021);
7. " The Kenya Roads (Amendment) Bill, 2021 (National Assembly Bill No. 13 of 2021); :

5 : 8. The Computer Misuse and Cybercrimes (A d t) Bill (National A bly Bill No. 11 of 2021)
i 7 ‘9. ' TheKenya Industrial R ch and Development Institute Bill ( ional Assembly Bill No. 44 of 2021);
e 10.  The National Construction Authority (Amendment) Bill, 2020 (National Assembly Bill No. 45 of 2020);
11, The Kenya Deposit Insurance (Amendment) Bill (National A bly Bill No. 43 of 2020); ;
12.  ThePublic Procurement and Asset Disposal (Amendment) (No. 3) Bill (National Assembly Bill No. 49 of 2020);
13. _The Irrigation (Amendment) Bill (National Assembly Bill No. 12 of 2021); ; ; !

14.  The Tax Appeals Tribunal (Amendment) Bill (National Assembly Bill No. 19 of 2021).

UBMISSION OF MEMORAND

T S

Pursuant to Article 118(1) (b) of the Constitution and Standing Order 127(3) of the National Assembly Standing = : exclusive preference from the sum of five hundred million shillings totwenty billion shillings. This is roprotecnhé Kenyan
Orders, the Clerk of the National Assembly hereby invites members of the public and relevant stakeholders to : traders from foreign competitors. s 5

submit da on the aforementioned Bils, whose objects are asfollows; : i The Irrigation (Amendment) Bill, 2021 ] bly Bill No. 12 of 2021) seeks to amend the Act by
The Higher Education Loans Board (Amendment) Bill, 2020 (National Assembly Bill No. 37 of 2020) ding the inistration of irrigation matters to include and I of irrigation matters. The -~

sponsored by Hon. Paul Muwirigi, MP, Igembe South Constituency, seeks to amend the Higher Education Loans Bill further seeks to amend the Act to harmonize the provision of the Irrigation Act, Water Act and Water Resources

. . Board Act in order to provide that a foanee shall commence the repayment of his or her loan once he or she secures . © Management Rules, 2007. ¥ ¥
3 employment. The amendment is meant to cushion unemployed graduates from being charged interest on the loan - * ' thaTax e TAbunal ( d t) Bill oot A bly Bill No. 19 of 2021) seeks to amend the Tax
2 before they have secured employment. : :. Appeals Tribunal Act, 2013 to address the challe affecting the perf e of the Tax Appeals Tribunal to facilitate

The Pharmacy and Polsons (Amendment) Bill, 2021 (National Assembly No 1 of 2021) sponsored by Hon. the expedition of tax disputes in the country.. 3

Alfred Keter, MP, Nandi Hills (Eonstltuency, seeks to amend the Pharmacy and Poison Act to prohibit the sale of . pyrsuant to Standing Order 127(1) of the National Assembly Standing Orders, the Bills proposing
dispensing of medicine without written prescription from a registered medical practitioners : v

: g . i amendments to the various Acts of Parliament are committed to Departmental Committees of the National
fi The Health ( d t) Bill, 2021 1A bly No 14 of 2021) sponsored by Hon. Moses Mwambu - Assembly as set out in the schedule hereunder: &
h} Wekesa Mab MP, la Co seeks to amend the Health Act No 21 of 2017 to provide that the % -
jonal g and county goverr shall, in ¢ Itation through the existing inter-governmental relations : - SCHEDULE I

chhanlsm establis}_y regional cancer centers; to mz{ke it an offence for q per‘son In-charg.e ofa Pubh‘c. Health fac)lity ; No.. e S e BLL. R % 7 COMMITTEE
to demand or permit of payments of advance medical fees as pre-condition for.the provision of medical services; to . - a = T - P e
make it an offence for person in-charge of a Public Health facility to detain a body of deceased person as means of " | 1, |The Higher Education Loans Board { Bill, 2020 Bill and
enforcing settlement of outstanding medical bills and to provide for regulation on levying of charges for the practice of No.37) E Research
conventional medical practice. : 2. |ThePharmacy and Poisons dment) Bill (National Assembly No 1 0f2021) Health
The National Electronic Single Window System Bill, 2021 (National Assembly Bill No: 15 of 2021) seeksto’ | 3 The Health iment) Bill | Assembly No 14 of 2021)

; provide for. the establi and op lization of the National Electronic Single Window System in order to 4. |The Computer Misuse and Cybercri dment) Bill (National Assembly Bill C i
facilitate trade, the establishment of the Kenya Trade Network Agency, to provide for electronic transactions, and for - No. 11 0f2021) : Information and

' connected purposes. ; : 5 S ; Innovation

¢ The Coffee Bill, 2021 (National Assembly Bill No. 17 of 2021) seeks to provide for development, regulation and 5. |The Coffee Bill, 2021 (National Assembly Bill No. 17 of 2021) ) Agriculture and
promotion of the Coffee Industry, provide for establishment, powers and functions of the Coffee Board of Kenya. : Livestock
The C ity Groups Reg jon Bill, 2021 (i 1A bly Bill No.20 of 2021) seeks to provide a  : 6. |TheC Groups Reglstration Bill | bly Bill No.20 0f 2021) Labour and Social

“ regulatory k for the ion and regulation of c ity groups and connected purposes. : Welfare -
The Kenya Roads ( dment) Bill, 2021 (National A bly Bill No. 13 of 2021) sponsored by Hon. David 7. |KenyaIndustrial hand D Institute Bill (National Assembly Bill | Trade, Industry and
Pkosing, MP, Pokot South Constituency, seeks to amend the Kenya Roads Act (No. 2 of 2007) to align the Act with the No. 44 of 2021); Cooperatives
provisions of the Constitution with regard to the auditing functions of the Office of the Auditor-General. The Act currently 8. |TheKenya Roads dment) Bill, 2021 | bly Bill No. 130f2021) .| Transport, Public
refers to the defunct office of the Controller of Budget and the Auditor-General. The Bill further seeks to amend the term - 9. |The National i hority ( dment) Bill, 2020 Assembly Bill| Works and Housing
of office of and the qualification for the Director-General of the Kenya Roads Board appointed under the Act. : H . |No. 45 0f 2020) i
b The Computer Misuse and Cybercrimes (Amendment) Bill, 2021 (National A bly Bill No. 11 of 2021) i [ 10, |TheKenyaDepositinsurance (Amendment) Bill (National Assembly Bill No.43 of - | Finance and National

3 sponsored by Hon. Aden Bare Duale, MP, Garissa Township Constituency, seeks to amend The Computer Misuse - 2020) S Planning

andh%sircenon;e;e/::; i(?c Irsn u:i er::ntie f&,)r ::rsizhf’linan ag‘amste :ht[z_ sl.‘mnngn Zf p;:rnogn;g}z through the internetand 11 [The Public Procurement and Asset Disposal{ irént) (No. 3) Bill *
¢ prol s e 0 pros rrorism, extreme religious and cult activitie: : Assembly Bill No. 49 of 2020)
Kenya In'dustrlal Research and D pment Bill, 2021 Bill No. 44 0f 2021) seeks 12, |The National Electronic Single Window System Bill, 2021 (National Assembly Bill No. |.
to establish the Kenya Industrial Research and Development Institute, and for connected purposes. It further provides 1502021) .
for the pi ion of research, d technofogy and i ion in industrial and allied technologies, and for roETE = re
initiation and support of industrial development. 13._[The Tax Appeals Tribunal ( Bill Bill No. 19 of 2021) <
1, . Troant) 1A P

The National Construction Authority (Amendment) Bill, 2020 ( I bly Bill No. 45 of 2020) L b ol kb Gk ::‘{L';:’:‘:;x:i
sponsored by Hon. David Gikaria, MP, Nakuru Town East Constituency, seeks to amend the National Construction

Authority Act, No. 41.0f 2011 to ensure women, youth and persons living with disabilities with start-up businesses who
apply to be registered as contractors under category six, seven and eight are exempted from paying the prescribed fee.
The amendment seeks to recognize women, youth and persons living with disabilities as marginalized groups and to
cushion them from the burden of paying registration fees.

The Kenya Deposit (A dment) Bill, 2020 ional A bly Bill No. 43 of 2020) sp d Thi da may be addressed to the Clerk of the National Assembly, P.O. Box 41842-00100, Nairobi;

The Bills were read a First Time pursuant to Standing Order 127(3) on 8" and 9t June 2021. Copies of the Bills
are available at the National Assembly Table Office, or on w@mﬂgﬂh&m&mﬁﬁﬂﬂm
house-business/bills. ;

N SV

( e
by Hon, Abdul Rahim Dawood, MP, Imenti North Constituency, seeks to amend section 28 of the Kenya Deposit i hand-delivered to the Office of the Clerk, Main Parliament Buildings; Nalrobi; or emailed to :Ierk@parlﬂnjm.,(q o

[ Insurance Act, 2012 in order to increase the maximum amount a person with an account with an institution under : goke; 16 be received on or before Friday 18" June, 2021, at 5.00 pm.
liquidation is to be paid by the Kenya Deposit Insurance Corporation. It further seeks to delete the provision limiting the

maximum amount a person is to be paid by the Corporation despite having different accounts. : g MICHAEL SIALAI, CBS 3
The Public Procurement and Asset Disposal (Amendment) (No. 3) Bill, 2020 (National Assembly Bill No.49 L 0 ONAL ASSEMB
4 of2020) sponsored by Hon. Benjamin Gathiru Mwangi, MP, kasl Central C y, seeks to amend  } 11* June 2021

the Public Procurement and Asset Disposal Act, 2015 to enhance the amount for tenders where Kenya citizens are given

oo an Y






