
SPECIAL ISSUE

Kenya Gazette Supplement No. 173 9l D"""^b",
t23t

2014

( kgislative Supplement No. 60)

CORRIGENDA

IN lrgal Noticc No .93 ol2O14-

(i) in the fisrt column delere the expression panted h u

Help Mission Medical Centre" and insert the cxpression.
"Mary Helper of the Sick Health Centre Ngarariga": and 

.

(ii) in the Second column delete the expression printed as "P.O.-
Box 25,1-O 1004, Kanjuka. Thika" and insert the expression
"P.O. Box 220-{0217, Limuru".

LEGAL NoncE No. 178

THE INSURANCE ACT

(Cap.487)

tN EXERCISE of the powers conferred by section 180 of the
Insurance Act, the Cabinet Secretary for Finance makes the following
Regulations:-

THE INSURANCE (AMENDMENT) REGULATIONS, 20I4

l. These Regulations may be cited as the lnsurance (Amendment)
Regulations, 2014.

2. Thc Fiftecnth Schedule to the lnsurance Regulations is
amended

(a) in Pan A-
(i) by deleting the expression "eighteen per cent (18%)"

appearing in paragraph I I and substituting therefor the
expression "twenty per cent (20%)";

(ii) by deleting the expression "3tst December, 2015"
appearing in the proviso to paragraph I I and
substituting therefor the expression "3lst December,
2020".

(b) in Part B-
(i) by deleting the expression "eighteen per cent (18%)"

appearing in paragraph 5(i) and substituting therefor the
expression "twenty per cent (20%)";

(ii) by deleting the expression "3lst Decembcr, 20t5"
appearing in the proviso to paragraph 5(i) and
substituting therefor ths cxpression "3lst December,
2020":

T,

Citllion.

Sub. t 8



t232 Kenya Subsidiory Izgislation, 2014

(iii) by deleting the expression "eighteen per c€nt (18%)
appearing in paragraph 5(ii) and substituting therefor the
expression "twenty per cent (20%)";

(iv) by deleting the expression "3lsl December, 2015"
appearing in the proviso to paragraph 5(ii) and
substituting therefor the expression "3lst December,
2020".

Made on the l6th December, 2014.
HENRY ROTICH,

Cabine t S ecretary, N otional Treasury

LEGAL NoTtCE No. I79

THE NATIONAL TRANSPORT AND SAFETY AUTHORITY ACT
(No.33 of20t4)

IN EXERCISE of the powers confered by section 54 of the
National Transpon and Safety Authority Act, the Cabinet Secretary for
Transpon and lnfrastructure, in consultation with the National
Transport and Safety Authority Board makes the following
Regulations:-

THE NATIONAL TRANSPORT AND SAFETY AUTHORITY
(OPERATION OF PUBLIC SERVICE VEHICLES) (AMENDMENT

NO. 2) REGULATIONS, 2014

l. Thcse Regulations may be cited as the National Transpon and
Safety Authority (Operation of Public Service Vehicles) (Amendment No.
2) Regulations, 2014.

2. Regulation 2 of dle National Transpon and Safety Authority
(Operation of Public Service Vehicles) Regulations, 2014, in these
Regulations referred o as the principal Regulations are amended-

(a) by inserting the following ncw definition in the pmper
alphabetical order-

"innovalive decorations" means imy pictures, words,
symbols or lighting which is painted, sprayed, &awn or affixed
to the body of a Public Service vehicle, whether in one or
several colows:

fb) in the definition of the word "Commuter Service vehicle" by
deleting the words "of a city or other urban area or between
such city or urban area and its satellite towns" and
substituting thereforc the words "Nairobi city, Mombasa city
and Kisumu city and Nakuru town, Machakos town, Eldoret
town, Thika town and such other urban areas as may b€
determined by the Cabinet Secretary from time to time."

3. Regulation ? of the Principal Regulations is amended -
(a) in paragaph C) by insening he words "in letten not less than

t€n inchcs in height and in such a colour as to bc visible by day
ftom a distance of at least two hundred and sevenry five

L.N. 2l of 2014

..:
_Il



Kcnya S ubsd ary Lc gis bnon, 20 I 4 1233

mctlrs" lruncdltlly rffcr thc words 'lchrcle opcrrtcs";
@) by inscrting thc folbwing ncw pa-rgnphs immcdirEly rftcr

pangnph (t)-
fl) ensurc thrt dl innovrtlve dccorrtions rrc not offqtsivc;

(m) cnsurc o|at no innovrlivc dccoralions rrc printrd, sprrycd,
dnwn on or rffircd to my wirdow, thc front ard brk
wudsc]lals, hghts, indrcrtors or chcvrons of thc vchicle

(n) orsurc thrt nonc of thc prsscngcr, co{rivct rnd drivcr
wmdows, drc ftort rnd brk windscrecns, lighs,
mdlcrtors o( chcuons of thc yehiclc re tintad or printcd,
spnycd or dnwn on .ny lnnovlbvc dccorrtions'

(o) cnsuc tnt innovetivc dccorations do not hrve rrflccttvc
pmp€fucs; and

(p) cnsurc that no dditiond crtcrior rnd rntcnor hghting rs
dfixed othcr thm thosc affixcd by thc manufrcturer of
the vchiclc.

4. Rcgulrtron 9 of thc princpd Rcguhbns is rnrrdcd by -
(a) rcnumbcnng rcguhbon 9 as reguhbon 9( I );

(b) inscrting thc following ncw plrrgrdrs unmcdirrcly aftcr
rcguhtion 9(l)-

(2) Thc Audpnty shdl not hcasc rny new Publ.ic Savicc Vchiclc
as Cornmutlr Scf,vicc Vchiclc whcc scrtDg clrryulg qprcrty is lcss thm
twcIlty-fivc p[scDgcrs.

(3) Thc Authoiry sh!.ll not, wllh cffcct from thc lst Jmurry,2016,
Irncw thc licencc of eny h.lbLc Scfvrc€ Vdrrcle whosc scrbng curyng
crprcity rs lcss thm twcnty fivc p.sscntcrs.

5 L,cgd Noticc No. lll of 2m6 .Dd Lrgd Noticc No. 209 of
2010 arc rcvokcd.

Madc on thc l5$ Dcccmbcr,2014.
MCHAELKAMAU,

Cabinct Secrcmry Jor Transpon and nfrastucturc.

LECAL NoTICE No. I8O

THE TRAFFIC ACT

Gap. 4o3)

DEC-I-ARATIoN

IN EXERCISE of thc powcrs confcncd by scction 2 of thc Trrffic
Act, thc Nrtiond Trrnspon lnd Safcty Authority dcclrrcs thc typc of
motor vchiclc dclcribcd rn thc Schcdulc not to bc r commcrcial vchiclc,
for thc purposcs of thc Acl.



1234 Kcnyo Subsidiory lz gislarion, 2014

SCHEDT]LE

Doublc Crbm Prck-up

Detcd thc ltth Deembcr, 2014.

LEE KINYANJUI,
C hoirpcrson,
Notionol Transport and Safcty
Authority.

FRANSCIS MEIA,
Drcctor-Gcncrol,

Natroral Tronsport and SaJcty
Authonty-

NTE) ANO 
'I,IUSHED 

tY THE (|oVIINUlNT ttINIEt, NNtOtt


