
YO uGb t

{

.t , l,,Ut Tijit]

' 1 I i. . : r

. 1 REPUBLIC,OF KENYA A
E [,"Fozo

Pa RL tANIElvTHE NATIONAL ASSEMBLY OF KENYa
--_LI BRARY

TWELFTH PARLIAMENT - FOURTH SESSION _2020

DEPARTMENTAL COMMITTEE ON JUSTICE AND LEGAL AFFAIRS

l-

I

REPORT

oN THE CONSIDERATTON OF THE REFERENDUM (NO. 2)BLLL
(NATTONAL ASSEMBLY BrLL NO. 14 OF 2020)

CLE,RK'S CHAMBERS
DIRECTORATE OF COMMITTEE SERVICES
PARLIAMENT BUILDINGS
NAIROBI

OCTOBER,2O2O

l



I
Y

!

I.O PREFACE .....5

1.1 Establishment and Mandate of the Committee............ ....'.'.'..,.,.......5

Chairperson ...... ......6

2.1 Memorandum of Objects and Reasons......

CHAPTER THREE... ....... tl
3.0 PUBLIC PARTICIPATION IN TI{E REVIEW OF THE BILL......... .......1I

3.I MATRIX OF STAKEHOLDERS SUBMISSIONS ll
3.1.1 National Council of Churches of Kenya

q

...1 1

...243.1.2 Council of Governors....

CHAPTER FOUR...... .......30

4.0 CONSIDERATION OF THE BILL BY THE COMMITTEE........ .......,....30

CHAPTER FIVE ..............37

5.0 COMMITTEE REOMMENDATION ,.,..,.,...,,37

I

I

2 I P a g e JLAC Report on the Referendum Bill (No. 2), 2020



tt

lr

LIST OF AI\NEXURES

Annexure 1:

Annexure 2:

Annexure 3:

Annexure 4:

Minutes of Committee sittings on consideration of the Bill

Adoption list

Copy of the newspaper advertisement inviting the public to present
written submissions on the Bill.

Copies of written submission received from stakeholders

t

t

L

L

- 
-----;'

3 | P a g e JLAC Repofi on the Referendum Bill (No. 2), 2020



CHAIRPERSON'S FOREWORD

The Referendum (No.2) Bill, 2020 (National Assembly Bill No.14) underwent First Reading on 1 8th

June, 2020 and was immediately committed to the Departmental Committee on Justice and Legal

Affairs for review and report to the House pursuant to the provisions of Standing Order 127(l) of the

National Assembly Standing Orders..

The Bill seeks to consolidate the law relating to the conduct of referenda, to provide for a transparent

and fair process in order to obtain a clear expression of the will of the people by establishing the

procedures forthe conduct of referenda,providing forthe referendum committees and establishing a

level playing field for the opposers and supporters of a referendum question, by providing for equal

public funding and by limiting expenditure in a reasonable manner for the public good, to afford the

people an opportunity to make decisions based on information from both points of view.

Pursuant to the provisions of Article I 18 of the Constitution and Standing Order 127 (3) the

Committee through an advertisement in the local daily newspapers of 30th June, 2020 invited the

public to make representations on the Bill and further resolved to seek the views of the following
institutions; Office of the Attorney-General and Department of Justice, Kenya Law Reform

Commission, Law Society of Kenya (LSK). Council of Governors and the County Assemblies

Forum. The Committee received submissions from the Kenya Christian Professionals Forum, the

Council of Govemors and the National Council of Churches of Kenya.

May I take this opportunity to commend the Committee Members for their devotion and

commitment to duty which made the consideration of the Bill successful. May I also express

gratitude to the Offices of Speaker and Clerk of the National Assembly for providing direction and

the Committee secretariat for providing technical and logistical support.

On behalf of the Departmental Committee on Justice and Legal Affairs and pursuant to the

provisions of Standing Order 199 (6), it is my pleasant privilege and duty to present to the House the

report of the Committee on the Referendum (No.2) 8i11,2020.

Hon. Muturi Kisano. M.P.

t

{

4 | P a ge JLAC Report on thc ReJerendum Bill (Iitt. 2),2020



a

CHAPTER ONE
1.0 PREFACE
1.1 Establishment and Mandate of the Committee
l. The Departmental Committee on Justice and Legal Affairs derives its mandate from

Standing Order No. 216(5) which provides for the functions of Departmental Committees
as follows-

(a) investigate, inquire into, and report on all matters relating to the mandate,
management, activities, administration, operations and estimates of the assigned
ministries and departments;

(b) study the prograrnme and policy objectives of ministries and departments and the
effectiveness of their implementation;

(c) study and review all legislation referred to it;
(d) study, assess and analyse the relative success of the ministries and departments as

measured by the results obtained as compared with their stated objectives;
(e) investigate and enquire into all matters relating to the assigned ministries and

departments as they may deem necessary, and as may be referred to them by the
House;

(0 vet and report on all appointments where the Constitution or any law requires the
National Assembly to approve, except those under Standing Order 204 (Committee
on Appointments)

(g) examine treaties, agreements and conventions;
(h) make reports and recommendations to the House as often as possible, including

recommendation of proposed legislation;
(i) consider reports of Commissions and lndependent Offices submitted to the House

pursuant to provisions of Article 254 of the Constitution; and

0) Examine any questions raised by Members on a matter within its mandate.

2. The Second Schedule of the Standing Orders on Departmental Committees further
outlines the Subjects of the Committee, as follows-

(a) Constitutional affairs;
(b) The administration of law and Justice
(c) The Judiciary;
(d) Public prosecutions;
(e) Elections:
(0 Ethics, integrity and anti-comrption; and
(g) Human rights.

,-

5 | P a g e JLAC Report on the ReJ'erendum Bill (No. 2), 2020



I

1.2 Committee Membership

3. The Committee was constituted on Thursday, l4th December, 20l7.The current
membership is as follows-

Chairperson
Hon. Clement Muturi Kigano, M.P.

Kangema Constituency
Jubilee ParQ

Vice Chairoerson
Hon. (Dr.) Paul Otiende Amollo, M.P.

Rarieda Constituency
ODM - Party

Hon. John Olago Aluoch, M.P
Kisumu West Constituency
FORD-Kenya

Hon. Roselinda Soipan Tuya, M.P.
Narok County
Jubilee Party

Hon. Emmanuel Wangwe, M.P
Navakholo Constituency
Jubilee-Party

Hon.Josephine Naisula Lesuuda, M.P
Samburu West Constituency
KANU-Party

Hon. Jennifer Shamalla, M.P.
Nominated MP
Jubilee Party

Hon.Anthony Oluoch M.P
Mathare Constituency
ODM-Parfy

Hon. George Gitonga Murugara, M.P
Tharaka Constituency
Democratic Party (DP)

Hon. John Kiarie Waweru, M.P
Dagoretti South Constituency
Jubilee-Party

Hon. George Peter Kaluma, M.P
Homa Bay Town Constituency
ODM-Party

Hon.Junet Sheikh Mohammed, M.P
Suna East Constituency
ODM-Party

Hon.W.Kamoti Mwamkale, M.P
Rabai Constituency
ODM-Party

Hon. Zuleikha Hassan. M.P.
Kwale County
ODM-Party

Hon.Robert Gichimu Githinji, M.P
Gichugu Constituency
Jubilee-Party

Hon. John Munene Wambugu, M.P
Kirinyaga Central
Jubilee -Party

Hon. Anthony Githiaka Kiai, M.P
Mukurueni Constituency
Jubilee-Party

Hon. Japheth Mutai, M.P.
Bureti Constituency
Jubilee-Party

-t

5 | P a g e JLAC Report on the Referendum Bill (No. 2), 2020



LY

Hon. Adan Haji Yussul M.P.
Mandera West Constituency
Economic Freedom Party

{

7 | P a g e JLAC Report on the Referendum Bill (No. 2), 2020



yJ

1.3 Committee Secretariat

4. The Committee secretariat is as follows-

Mr. Abenayo Wasike
Senior Clerk Assistant

Lead Clerk

Mr. Denis Abisai
Principal Legal Counsel I

Mr. Ahmed Hassan Odhawa
Principal Research Officer

Ms. Roselyne Ndegi
Serjeant-at-Arms I

Ms. Halima Hussein
Clerk Assistant II

Mr. Omar Abdirahim
Fiscal Analyst III

Mr. Joseph Okongo
Media Liaison Officer

\

,

5. Minutes of siuings of the Committee on the consideration of the Bill. (Annexure 1)

8 ! P a ge JLAC Report on the Referendum Bill (No. 2),2020



d

a

CHAPTER TWO

2.0 BACKGROUND ON THE REFERENDUM (NO.2) BILL. 2O2O

2.1 Memorandum of Obiects and Reasons

6. The principal object of this Bill is to consolidate the law relating to conduct of referenda,
to provide for a transparent and fair process in order to obtain a clear expression of the
will of people, by establishing the procedures for the conduct of referenda, providing for
the referendum committees and establishing a level playing field for the opposers and
supporters of a referendum question, by providing for equal public funding and by
limiting expenditure in a reasonable manner for the public good, to afford the people an
opportunity to make decisions based on information from both points of view.

7. Clauses I to 3 provide for preliminary matters including the short title, interpretation and
the application of the Elections Act to referendum.

8. Clause 4 provides for the proclamation of a referendum to amend the Constitution in
relation to matters specified in Articles 255 (l) and257 (10) of the Constitution. Upon
proclamation, the Independent Electoral and Boundaries Commission shall conduct a

referendum in 90 days and if the Bill is approved, the President assents to it within seven
days,

9. Clause 5 provides conduct of referendum by popular initiative while clause 6 provides for
the manner of preparing the Bill to amend the Constitution

10. Clause 7 provides for other forms of referendum including county referendums.
I l. Clause 8 provides that a referendum could also be initiated through an Act of Parliament.

This section contemplates separate law for a specific referendum. Such law shall specify
the wording of the referendum question or option.

12. Clause 10 provides for the referendum notice. The notice shall contain key particulars
including the nature and purpose of the referendum, the referendum question(s) or
options, the symbols assigned for each answer, the date of the referendum, polling time,
date of registration of referendum committees the campaign period for the referendum.

13. Clause I I provides for formation and registration of referendum committees.
14. Clause 12 provides for the appointment of the chief agent for every referendum

committee.
15. Clause l3 provides for costs of referendum committees and invokes the relevant sections

of the Election Campaign Financing Act, 2013.
16. Clause 14 provides for the approval threshold in a referendum which is at least twenty

percent of the registered voters in each of at least half of the counties vote in the
referendum and the majority of the citizens voting in the referendum.

17. Clause 15 provides for a general power of the Commission to take administrative
measures to ensure successful conduct of a referendum.

18. Clauses 16 to 32 provide for referendum petitions including application procedures,
persons who may present petitions, respondents, composition of the Court, security for
costs, hearing of petitions, examination of votes and petition expenses.

9 | P a Ce JL.,IC Report on the Ref'erendum Bill (No.2).2020



I

i

19. Clauses 33 to 40 provides for general provisions including dealing with the documents,
offences and general penalty, application of the Election Offences Act, 2016, duty to
cooperate, prosecutions and arrests and regulations.

20. Clauses 41 to 71 deal with consequential amendments.
21. The Bill does not limit fundamental rights and freedoms.
22.T\e Bill concerns county governments in terms of Article I l0(1) (a) of the Constitution.
23. The Bill is not a money Bill within the meaning of Article I 14 of the Constitution.

,

ll

10 I P a g e JLIIC Report on the Referendum Bill (No. 2), 2020



CHAPTER THREE

3.0 PIIBI,IC PARTICIPATION IN THE REVIEW OF THE BILL

24.The Committee undertook public participation on the Bill in compliance with the
provision of Article I l8 (l) (b) of the Constitution as read together with Standing Order
127 (3). Adverts inviting the public to make any submission regarding the Bill were put
in local daily newspapers of Tuesday 3Otn June, 2020. (Annexure 3).

25. The Committee received written submissions on the Bill from the Kenya Christian
Professional Forum (KCPF), the Council of Governors (COG) and the National Council
of Churches of Kenya (NCCK) as per the matrix below;(Annexure 4)

3.1 MATRIX OF'STAKEH LDERS SUBMISSIONS

3.1.1 National Council of Churches of Kenva

keholder Clause Provision in
the Bill

Stakeholder
Proposal

Rationale Committee
observations

2 "referendum"
means a poll
held under
this Act

Expand definition
so as to read:
Referendum is a

direct and
universal vote in
which an entire
electorate is
invited to vote on
a proposed
constitutional
amendment or
any other matter
of national or
county
importance

There is need for
the law to provide
for the different
types of
referendums

The proposed
definition
contains
substantive
provisions
which may
conflict with
specific clauses
in the Bill

NCCK

3( I )(a) Provides that
eligibility to
vote is guided
by the
Elections Act
20tt

Amend to
provide that the
voter can vote in
any polling
station in the
country ( during a

national level
referendum) or in
the county (
during a county
level referendum)

The
Constitutional,
legislative or
policy changes
effected by the
referendum
would affect the
voter wherever
they are within
the geographical
scope of the
proposed

The proposed
amendment may
lead to logistical
problems in the
conduct of a

referendum
including the
determination of
number of ballot
papers required
in a polling
station

Committee
Recommenda
Retain definit:
contained in
Bill

Proposed
amendment re

11 I P a g e JLAC Report on the Referendum Bill (No. 2), 2020



amendment
opposed
election
representatives
which
geographical
sensitive

ls

AS

to
of

J 3(2) Provides that
necessary
modifications
are to be done
to the
procedure of
elections to
provide
Procedures for
conducting
referendums

Expand to
provide for:
a) who
undertakes the
modifications
b)in which
document will the
modifications be
recorded
c) provision of
public
participation in
the process of
modification
d) Timelines for
the modifications

Considering that
the procedures for
conducting
referendums are
essential to the
outcome, it is
necessary to
specifically
allocate the task
to a specific
person with
specific timelines
and to allow other
stakeholders to
contribute

The proposal
seeks to provide
greater certainty
and may be
considered

4 4 Provide
timeline of l4
days for the
president to
publish a

notice
directing the
IEBC to
conduct a

referendum

Amend to
provide
guidelines on
what is to happen
should president
fail to direct the
IEBC to conduct
the referendum
within 14 days.
Also provide for
what happens
should the
president find
that the bill from
parliament is
defective or if
the proposed
amendment
would offend
another section of
the constitution

The laws need to
have clear
provisions to
avoid: a) A
referendum
process aborted
due to inaction by
the president
b) presentation of
a defective or
unconstitutional
bill to the people
for a referendum

It is not possible
for the law to
contemplate and
provide for
every
eventuality. The
Act may assume
that the
President will
act in
accordance with
the provisions of
the Constitution
and the law.

5 5(2)and
s (3)

5(2)refers to
signatures

Reconcile the
language. stick to

This would avoid
any resultant

Proposal seeks
to provide

Amend Bill
be appr
Regulations
provide for
details.

Amend Bill
be appr(
Regulations
provide for
details.

Amend Bill r

121P a g e JLAC Report on the Referendum Bill (No. 2), 2020

be



being
delivered to
the
commission,
while s(3)
refers to the
list of
supporters
submiued in
s(2)

signatures
the word confusion as to

the intention of
the drafters.

greater certainty
and may be
considered.

6 s(3Xc) Provides that
the IEBC is to
submit the
draft Bill to
each
Assembly for
consideration

Amend to include
a timeline by
which the IEBC
is to submit the
draft bill to the
county
Assemblies. We
propose three
months.
Remove the
provision giving
county
assemblies three
months to
consider the Bill
and insert it as a
new article 5(6)
then renumber

This is necessary
to avoid
unnecessary delay
or frustration of
promoter due to
failure by the
IEBC to
undertake the
verification in a

timely manner

The timeline of
three months is
already provided
for in Clause 5
of the Bill.

7 s(4) Provides that
the Bill and
supporters are
to be made
public

Amend to
provide for the
manner in which
the bill and
supporting names
and signatures are
to be made public
and the
timeframe for the
same. Provision
should also be
made for appeal
by any individual
whose name and
signature appear
on the list but
they do not
support the

This will provide
guidelines for the
IEBC regarding
when to make the
Bill and
supporting names
and signatures
public and how .

The appeal will
prevent
fraudulent use of
individual's
signatures to
support a
proposed
amendment.

Proposal seeks

to provide
greater certainty
and may be
considered.

Regulations
provide for f
details.

The timelinr
three month
already prc
for in Clause
the Bill.

Amend Bill ar

be approl
Regulations
provide for f
details.

13 ! P a g e JLAC Report on the Referendum Bill (No. 2), 2020



proposed
amendments

8 5(s) Where the
commission
finds that the
provision of
Article 257
have not been
met, it shall be
declared that
the draft Bill
has failed

Amend to
provide for an
appeal by the
promoters of the
Bill. The
timelines for the
appeal should be
reasonable ( we
propose 30 days)

This will accord
the promoters
their
constitutional
right to fair
hearing and fair
administrative
action

The
requirements of
Article 257 of
the Constitution
are rigid and
there is no room
for appeal

9 s(6) Provides that
if the bill is
approved by
more than half
of the county
Assembly

Provide a

timeline within
which the Bill
should be heard
and determined
by both houses of
parliament. We
propose three
months

This will ensure
that there is no
undue delay in
processing the
Bill. A
referendum is a

serious issue of
national
importance and
should be
dispensed with
speedily

Proposal seeks
to provide a

timeline and
may be
considered.

l0 s(7) Provides that
the speakers
of both houses
of parliament
are to receive
the responses
from the
county
Assemblies

Amend to
provide that
where a county
Assembly
communicates to
only one speaker
of parliament,
then they will be
deemed to have
communicated to
both

The
communication
from the county
Assembly to
parliament should
be treated as one
entity.

Proposal
progressive
may
considered

IS

and
be

11 s(8Xa) Provides that
the Bill shall
lapse if it does
not relate to
matters
specified in
Article 255(l)
of the
constitution

theRemove
provision

This provision
contravenes the
constitution
which in article
257(10) provides
that if either
houses fail to
pass the bill OR
if the bill relates
to matters
specified in

Proposal may be
considered to
protect the right
of the people to
amend the
constitution
through a
popular
initiative for
issues that are
not specified in

Proposal to
Bill rejected

Amer.t Bill
be ap prial

Amend Bill r

be appropriat

Amend Bill r

be appropriat

14 | P a g e JLAC Report on the Referendum Bill (No. 2), 2020



Article 255(l),
the proposed
amendment is to
be passed to the
people in a

referendum. This
is to ensure that
the people's
choice on a

proposed
amendment is not
blocked by
parliament

Article 255(l)

t2 s(8)(b) Provides that
the proposed
amendment if
relates to
article 255(l)
of the
constitution ,

shall be
submitted to
the people in
referendum

Amend to
provide that if
one or both
houses of
parliament fail to
pass the bill , it is
passed to the
people in a

referendum

This is to ensure
that the Act is in
tandem with the
Constitution

This is a

legislative
drafting issue
which may be
considered

s(e) Provides that
the president
will proclaim
and direct the
commission to
conduct a

referendum

Amend to
indicate that the
president it to
give notice to the
IEBC through a

publication in the
Gazette requiring
them to conduct
the referendum

To specify how
the president is to
communicate to
the IEBC

Proposal seeks

to provide
greater certainty
and may be
considered.

13

s(e) Provides that
the president
will proclaim
and direct the
commission to
conduct a

referendum.

Amend to
provide
timelines( we
suggest 14 days)
within which the
president is to
publish the
Gazette and to
provide what is to
happen should
the president fail
to direct the
IEBC to conduct

This is to ensure
that the
presentation of
the bill to the
people in a

referendum is not
delayed due to
inaction on the
part of the
president

Proposal seeks
to provide
greater certainty
and may be
considered.

Amend Bill a:

be appropriate

Amend Bill ar

be appropriate

Amend Bill ar

be appropriate

15 | P a g e JLAC Report on the Referendum Bill (No. 2), 2020



the referendum.
Also provide for
what happens
should the
president find
that the bill is
defective or if
the proposed
amendment
should offend
another section
of the
constitution

15 s(1 1) Provides that
the IEBC is to
certify to the
president
whether the
Bill was
passed or not
within 7 days
after
conclusion of
referendum

Amend to reduce
the number of
days to two

There is no
administrative
process expected
to be conducted
after the results of
the referendum
has been declared
so that IEBC
should certify to
the president
within 48 hours

Proposal seeks
to expedite the
declaration of
the referendum
results and may
be considered

t6 6(1)
and 6
(2)

Provides that
the Bill to
amend article
2ss(1)
elements is to
be formulated
ina
participatory
and inclusive
manner and
that non-
divergent
proposals to
be contained
in a single Bill

theRemove
provision

This provision
add a hurdle to
promoters of an
amendment in
that:
a) participatory
and inclusive are
not defined
b) There is no
procedure
provided to
assess the
development of
the bill to ensure
its development
was participatory
c) There are no
provisions to
safeguard
promoters of an
amendment from
perpetual delays

Public
participation is a
national value
under Article l0
and Article 118

of the
Constitution.

Ame: ]ill
be approprial

Proposal to
Bill rejected

16 | P a g e JLAC Report on the Referendum Bill (No. 2), 2020



during attempts to
contain " non
divergent"
recommendations
into one bill
d) No framework
is provided for
consultations and
unification of
proposals into
one bill

t7 7 I( ) Introduces
possibility of
holding a

referendum
for any other
National issue

, and provides
that the
president shall
proclaim and
direct the
commission to
conduct the
referendum

Expand to
provide for:
a) who can
initiate a national
referendum
b) how petition is
made
c) Procedure
followed for the
petition to reach
the president
d) Elements to
determine
whether the
requests in the
petition qualify
for a referendum
e) outline of the
national issues

that may need a

referendum

This is necessary
for as drafted it
seems it is only
the president who
may call for the
referendum.
Provisions should
be included for
clarity and to do
away with
ambiguity.

Proposal seeks

to provide
greater certainty
and may be

considered.

18 7(2) Provides that
a county
government
can conduct a
referendum

Amend to read
that 'A'
referendum can
be held at county
level on local
issues. Then
expand to provide
for:
a) who can
initiate a request
for a national
referendum
b) How the
petition is made

This is necessary
for as drafted it is
ambiguous as to
the process of
building up to
and conducting
the county level
referendum.
Since provisions
on this are not
included in the
constitution they
need to be
included in the

Section 90 of
the County
Governments
Act provides for
the conduct of a

local
referendum

Amend Bill
other legislati
may be approF

Amend Bill
other legislati
may be approf

Ll I P a e e JLAC Report on the Referendum Bill (No. 2), 2020



c)procedure
followed for the
petition to reach
the Governor
d) Elements to
determine
whether the
requests in the
petition qualify
for a referendum
e) outline the
county issues that
may need a

referendum

0 How the
petition/guideline
for referendum is
presented to the
IEBC
g) Timelines for
the process

Act

l9 7(2)(b) Provides that
a petition and
investment
decisions shall
be signed by
at least 25%
of the voters
registered
where the
referendum is
to take place

Remove in view
of the opinion
made under 7(2)
above.
Where a petition
is to be made
provide that the
petition be signed
by at least l}Yo of
the registered
voters

Provide
petitions
signed
percent
registered voters
is punitive
considering that a
petition to amend
the constitution is
signed by I
million registered
voters which in
2010 was 8.3%
of the registered
voters

that
to be
by 25
of the

Proposal
reasonable
may
considered

IS

and
be

20 7(3) Provides that
the Elections
Act 2011 shall
apply, with
necessary
modifications,
during local
referendum

Expand to
provide for
a) Who
undertakes the
modifications
b) In which
document will the
modifications be
recorded
c) Provision for

It is necessary to
specifically to
allocate the task
of developing the
modifications to
ensure that
elections act
applies to a local
referendum.

Proposal seeks
to provide
greater certainty
and may be
considered.

Amend Bil
other legisla
may be appr<

Amend -Bil
other legisla
may be apprc

18 I P a g e .I LAC Report on the Referendum Bill (No. 2), 2020



public
participation in
the process of
modifications
d) Timelines for
the modifications

2t e( l) Procedure
upon the
commission
receiving
directions
from the
President to
conduct a
referendum
under Article
256 and 257
of the
constitution

Amend to include
notifications for
referendums
covered under
clause 7 of this
bill

To provide the
the same
procedure for
handling of the
different types of
referendums.

Clause 7(2)
provides that a
local
referendum shall
be conducted by
the county
govemment. It
is, therefore, not
necessary for the
President to
notify the
Commission of
the same.

22 e(8) Provides that
the
commission
shall subject
the question to
parliamentary
approval.

Provide that
parliament can
reject the
proposed
question only
twice after which
the question as

drafted by the
IEBC shall be
presented to the
voters in a

referendum.
Also provide that
parliament is to
take only 3 days
to deliberate on
the question and
notify the IEBC
within 3 days
after that

This is to preempt
a perpetual back
and forth cycle
between
parliament and
the IEBC on the
referendum
question
considering that
such will eat into
the 90 days
provided for
holding of the
referendum from
the time the bill is
received by the
IEBC.

Proposal seeks

to provide
greater certainty
and may be
considered.

23 10(2)
(d)

Provides that
the notice
shall specify
the day for
referendum

Review to
indicate that the
notice shall
provide the day
and date the
referendum is to
happen.

Clauses 5(9) and
(10) provide that
the referendum
must be
conducted and
concluded within
90 days of the

Proposal seeks

to provide
greater certainty
and may be
considered.

Proposal to a

Bill rejected.

Amend Bill ar

be appropriatc

Amend Bill ar

be appropriate

19 I P a g e JLAC Report on the Referendum Bill (No. 2), 2020



Review to
indicate that the
number of days
between
publication of the
notice and the
referendum shall
be held within 90
days from when
the IEBC
received the Bill
and notification
from the
President.

proclamation.
This should be
respected so that
the processes
between IEBC
and parliament
don't extend that
timeline.

24 ll Provide for
Referendum
committees

Reconsider the
requirement that
persons
campaigning for
or against the
referendum
question form
one national
referendum
committee.
Change to
indicate that
persons intending
to support or
oppose the
referendum
question will
form national and
constituency
referendum
committees.

The promoters of
referendum
should not be
obligated to form
a single
committee with
others who claim
they will support
the bill which
would open them
to subversive
elements.
Different groups
whether opposing
or supporting
should be allowed
to form their own
committees and
have them
registered by
IEBC. There
should be no limit
to the number of
referendum
committees that
the IEBC
registers.

The proposal is
reasonable and
also in
accordance with
Article 36(2) of
the Constitution
which provides
that a person
shall not be

compelled to
join an
association of
any kind.

25 13(2) Provides that
public money
may be used
to finance
activities of a

thisDelete
provlslon

Since the
activities of
referendum
committees are
not prescribed in

Election
Campaign
Financing Act,
No 42 of 2013,
would apDly to

Amend Bill
be appropriat

Amend Bill
be approprial

20 I P a g e .II-AC Reporl on the Referendum Bill (Mt. 2), 2020



referendum law,
accountability for
the same would
be problematic
and open to
injustice against
some committees

the referendum
committees

26 I 3-14 Provides for
referendum
committees

Insert a new
clause to provide
for referendum
committees
during county
kevel
referendums

Guidelines are
required for
referendum
committees
during county
level referendums

Proposal
reasonable
may
considered

IS

and
be

27 16 Provides for
petitions after
a referendum

There is need for
a provision on the
legal status of the
amended Articles
of the
Constitution
pending the
determination of
the petitions

This is to address
the potential
contradictions
that could arise
where
amendments have
been
implemented for
six months then
the court finds
that the
referendum was
not valid.
Reference can be
made to Article
l4l of the
Constitution

The Court which
finds that the
referendum was
invalid has the
discretion to
make
appropriate and
relevant
pronouncements

28 l8 (3) Provides that
a petitioner
shall publish
their petition
in the Gazette
and at least
one news
paper

Delete
requirement

the This is a punitive
measure on the
part of the
petitioner
considering that
similar
requirement is not
made during
other petitions
touching on
elections

Proposal
reasonable
may
considered

is
and

be

29 l8(4)

or
by

Provides for
personal
servlce
service

Provide
electronic
service

for The judiciary has

embraced
electronic filing
and service of

Proposal seeks

to increase the
methods of
service and may

Amend Bill
other legislati
may be approf

Proposal to a

Bill rejected

Amend Bill ar

be appropriate

Amend Bill ar

be appropriatc

2L I P a g e JLAC Report on the Referendum Bill (No. 2), 2020



advertisement documents be included.
30 24(2)

and (3)
Provides that
a petitioner
must deposit
lMillion as

security for
costs, failing
which the
petition may
be struck off

thisDelete
provision

Setting a

requirement for
security for costs,
is a barrier to
access to justice
and therefore
unconstitutional

The Committee
was of the view
that the deposit
of Ksh I
milllion was
reasonable in the
circumstances
since a

referendum
costs Billions to
conduct

3l 25 Provides for
what happens
when a

petitioner dies
before the
final order is
given

Add provision for
where there was
only one
petitioner, and
such petitioner
dies before the
final order is
given.

This is necessary
to remove the
ambiguity

Proposal seeks
to provide
greater certainty
and may be
considered.

.) /. 30
(3X4)
and (5)

Provides that
the registrar
shall within 7

days of send a

certified copy
of the decision
of the High
Court to the
commission
and issue a

certificate that
the hearing is
concluded,
upon which
the
commission
shall declare
and publish
the result of
the
referendum, in
accordance
with the
finding of the
high court.
It further

This contradicts
the provisions of
the clause 2l(2)
which permits
appeals to the
high court within
30 days of the
decision. There is
need to reconcile
the two
contradictory
provisions of the
bill by deleting
clause 2l that
provides for
appeal. Also
reduce the time
provided for the
registrar of the
court to
communicate to
IEBC to 2 days.

This will provide
clarity and enable
finality in
determination of
the petition

There is indeed
need to
harmonize the
provisions of
Clause 21(2)
and Clause
30(5) of the Bill

t

a

Proposal to
Bill rejected.

Amen.l Bill
be ap prial

Amend Bill
be approprial

22 | P a g e JLA(' Report on thc Referendum Bill (No. 2), 2020



!

provides that
the
declaration by
the
commission
shall be final
and shall not
be subject to
change.

33 t7
(3)(a)
le(1)
3t (2)

"Comrption
practices"
Mentioned as

grounds for
petition

Expand
encompass
wide range
election
malpractices
defined in law

as

to
the
of

Other election
malpractices
beyond comrpt
practices should
serve as grounds
for petitions

Proposal
reasonable
may
considered

IS

and
be

34 3t(2) Provides that
a person who
appears to
have been
guilty of any
corrupt
practice in the
referendum
may be
ordered to pay
costs related
to the trial

theRemove
provision

This provision
would deny such
persons the right
to be presumed
innocent until
proved guilty
since they would
not have been
tried for the
suspected corrupt
practices. There
would therefore
be an unjust
punishment.

The provision
infringes upon
the presumption
of innocent as

set out in Article
50(2)(a) of the
Constitution

35 33(l) Provides for
the
destruction of
referendum
documents six
months after
the
referendum is
concluded.

theRemove
provision

The referendum
is a key process
for the nation and
the records
therefore should
not be destroyed
until all court
process(petition
and appeal) are

concluded. Where
destruction of
materials us
necessary the law
should define
which materials
are to be retained
and which can be

Proposal
reasonable
may
considered

IS

and
be

Amend Bill ar

be appropriate

Amend Bill ar

be appropriate

Amend Bill a:

be appropriate

23 ! P a g e JLAC Report on the Referendum Bill (No. 2), 2020



,

destroyed

3.1.2 Council of Governors

Stakeholder Clau
se

Provision in
the Bill

Stakeholder
proposals

Rationale Committee
Observatio
ns

Committee
Recommendatio
ns

COG s(l ) For purposes
ofa
referendum
to amend the
Constitution
by popular
initiative
pursuant to
Article 257 of
the
Constitution,
the promoters
of the popular
initiative
shall collect
not less than
one million
signatures of
registered
voters, of
whom -(a) not more
than one third
shall be from
one county;
and
(b) voters in
at least
twenty four
counties shall
be
represented.

For purposes

ofa
referendum to
amend the
Constitution
by popular
initiative
pursuant to
Article 257 of
the
Constitution,
the promoters
of the popular
initiative
shall collect
not less than
one million
signatures of
registered
voters from at
least twenty
four counties

To enable
representation
from more than
half of the
Counties

Proposal is
reasonable
and may be
considered

Amend Bill as

may be
appropriate

s(3x
a)

(3) Upon
receipt of the
list of
supporters
under

3) Upon
receipt of the
list of
supporters
under

It is imperative
to have
timelines
within which
the commission

The
Committee
has already
proposed
amendment

Amend Bill as

may be
appropriate

24 | P a g e J LAC Report on the Referendum Bill (No. 2), 2020



subsection
(2), the
Commission
shall -(a) verify that
the initiative
is supported
by at least
one million
registered
voters and
meets the
criteria
set out under

subsection

(l);

subsection (2),
the
Commission
shall -(a) within a

period of 3

months,
verify that the

initiative is

supported by
at least one

million
registered

voters and

meets the

criteria set out

under

subsection(l)

has to verify
signatures

s to Clause
s(3xb) to
clarify on
the timeline
of three
months.

e(2) The
Commission
shall, within
seven days
after
framing the
question or
option, refer
the question
or option
to the

relevant

House for
approval.

Amend to
provide clarity
on which is

the relevant

house

It is important
define which is
the relevant
house to avoid
confusion as to
whether it is the
National
Assembly or
Senate

The
Committee
has already
proposed
amendment
s to Clause
9(2) to
clarify on
the issue.

Amend Bill as

may be
appropriate

I 3(2) Where public
money is
used to
finance the
activities of
referendum

Delete the sub

clause

Cost of
financing the
committees has

already been
provided under
the sub clause

Proposal is
reasonable
and may be
considered

Amend Bill as

may be
appropriate

25 | P a g e JLAC Report on the Referendum Bill (No. 2), 2020



committees,
it shall be
distributed
Equally
among the
registered
referendum
committees.

l. It is
responsibility
of the
promoters of
the bill to settle
the costs.

t6(2)
(a)

(2) A petition

(a) to
question the
validity of a

referendum
shall be
filed within
twenty eight
days after the
date of
declaration of
the results of
the
referendum
and
served within
fifteen days

of
presentation;

Petition
should be
served
within 7
days to
enable
parties
prepare
before hand

Amend Bill as

may be
appropriate

t6(2)
(b)

(b) to seek a
declaration
conceming
any matter
relating to the
referendum
shall be
presented
within
twenty-eight
days after the
proclamation
of
the
referendum
or occurTence

to seek a

declaration
concerning
any matter
relating to the
referendum
shall be
presented
within twenty-
eight days
after the
proclamation
of
the
referendum or
occrurence of

Petition should
be served
within 7 days to
enable parties
prepare before
hand

Proposal is
reasonable
and may be
considered

Amend Bill as

may be
appropriate

26 | P a g e JLAC Report on the Referendum Bill (No. 2), 2020



ofthe event
complained
against
whichever is
later.

the event
complained
against
whichever is
later. The
petition should
be served
within seven
days of
presentation

In the conduct
of a referendum
the commission
should act as a
neutral arbiter
and as such
should not be

allowed to file a
petition

The
Committee
has already
proposed
amendment
s to Clause
18 (2) to
clarify on
the issue.

Amend Bill as

may be

appropriate
( )c

l8 (1) (l) A
referendum
petition may
be presented
in the
High Court
by-
(c) the
Comrnission

Delete clause

20(2) Timelines
should be
stipulated
within which
the registrar
should inform
the commission
in writing to
enable adequate
preparation

The
Committee
has already
proposed
amendment
s to Clause
20 to
clarify on
the issue.

Amend Bill as

may be

appropriate

(2) Whenever
a referendum
petition is
presented
under
this section,
the Registrar
of the High
Court shall,
in
writing,
inform the
Comrnission
of the filing
of the petition

Whenever a

referendum
petition is
presented
under
this section,
the Registrar
of the High
Court shall
within 3 days
in
writing,
inform the
Commission
of the filing of
the petition

27 (3) Amend Bill as

may be

appropriate

All
reasonable
expenses
incurred by
any person in
attending at
or appearing
before the
High Court to
give
evidence as a

All reasonable
expenses
incurred by
any person in
attending at or
appearing
before the
High Court to
give
evidence as a

witness at the

It is prudent for
the bill to
specify who is
supposed to pay
the cost of the
witnesses to
attend the
meeting.

Proposal is
reasonable
and may be
considered

27 | P a g e J I-AC Report on the ReJere nelum Rill (No. 2), 2020



witness at the
trial of a

referendum
petition
shall be paid
to such
person
according to
the scale of
allowances
and expenses
appropriate in
civil
proceedings
before the
High Court.

trial of a

referendum
petition
shall be paid
to such person
by the
petitioner
according to
the scale of
allowances
and expenses
appropriate in
civil
proceedings
before the
Hieh Court.

30(6) (6) Where the
High Court
declares a

referendum
void,
the
Commission
shall conduct
a fresh
referendum
within
sixty days of
the
declaration

(6) Where the
proceedings
relate to the
conduct of the
referendum
and the Hugh
Court declares
a referendum
void, the
commission
shall conduct
a fresh
referendum
within sixty
days of the
declaration.

Referendum
should only be
held of the
nature of the
petition was
challenging the
conduct of the
person. If the
petition was
challenging the
legality'
validity of the
petition then it
would be
unnecessary to
conduct the
same.

Proposal is
reasonable
and may be
considered

Amend Bill as

may be
appropriate

28 I P a g e JLAC Report on the Referendum Bill (No. 2), 2020



Amend Bill as may
be appropriate

30(6) (6) Where the
High Court
declares a
referendum
void,
the Commission
shall conduct a

fresh
referendum
within
sixty days of the
declaration

(6) Where the
proceedings
relate to the
conduct of the
referendum and
the Hugh Court
declares a

referendum void,
the commission
shall conduct a

fresh referendum
within sixty days
of the
declaration.

Referendum
should only be
held of the nature
of the petition was
challenging the
conduct of the
person. If the
petition was
challenging the
legality/ validity of
the petition then it
would be
unnecessary to
conduct the same.

Proposal is
reasonable
and may be

considered

29 I P a g e JLAC Report on the Referendum Bill (No. 2), 2020



CHAPTER FOUR

4.0 CONSIDERATION OF THE BILL BY THE COMMITTEE

26.The Committee considered the Bill clause by clause and proposed amendments as
follows;

27. CLAUSE 2: THAT the Bill be amended in clause 2 by deleting the expression "Cabinet
Secretary."

28. Justification: To clean up the Bill because the term "Cabinet Secretary" is not used in
the Bill.

29. CLAUSE 5: THAT clause 5 of the Bill be amended-
a) In sub-clause (3) by deleting the words "after the date it was submitted by the

Commission" appearing in paragraph (c);
b) By deleting the expression "for" appearing in sub-clause (10).

30. Justification: To clarify that the Commission should submit the Draft Bill to each county
assembly within three months of verifying that the Bill meets the requirements of Article
257 of the Constitution.

31. CLAUSE 7: THAT the Bill be amended by deleting clause 7.

32. Justification: The Committee was of the view that it is not necessary to provide for local
referenda in the Bill. The local referenda may be held under Section 90 of the County
Governments Act, No.17 of 2012, as currently provided for.

33. CLAUSE 8: THAT the Bill be amended by deleting clause 8.

34. Justification: The Committee was of the view that it is not necessary to provide for other
referenda in the Bill. The Bill should be restricted to provide for the referenda
contemplated under the Constitution.

35. CLAUSE 9: THAT clause 9 of the Bill be amended-
a) in sub-clause (l) by deleting the words "or option" appearing immediately after

the word "question" appearing in the closing paragraph;
b) in sub-clause (2) by deleting the words "or option, refer the question or option to

the relevant House for approval" and substituting therefor the words "refer the
question to the Houses of Parliament for approval".;

c) in sub-clause (3) by deleting the words ooor option" appearing immediately after
the word'oquestion";

d) in sub-clause (4) by deleting the words "or option" wherever it appears;
e) in sub-clause (5) by deleting the words "or option" appearing at the end of the

sub-clause;

30 I P a g e JLAC Report on the Referendum Bill (lYo. 2), 2020



0 in sub-clause (6) by deleting the words "or option" wherever it appears;
g) in sub-clause (7) by deleting the words "or option" wherever it appears;

h) in sub-clause (8) by deleting the words "or option" wherever it appears;

i) in sub-clause (9) by deleting the words "or option" appearing immediately after
the word "question";

j) in sub-clause (10) by deleting the word "option" wherever it appears and

substituting therefor the word "question";
k) in sub-clause ( I I ) by deleting the words "or option" appearing immediately after

the word "question";
3t5. Justifications.' The Committee was of the view that the Commission should not provide

voters with other options other than approving or rejecting the referendum question. The
Committee noted that providing other options to voters may complicate the referendum
voting process and will also offend Article 82(2) of the Constitution which provides that
legislation enacted by Parliament on the conduct of elections and referenda shall ensure
that the voting is simple and transparent. The proposed amendment to sub-clause (2) also
seeks to remedy the ambiguity in the provision caused by the use of the term "relevant
House". The amendment clarifies that the question shall be referred to both Houses of
Parliament for approval.

31'.CLAUSE 10: THAT clause l0 of the Bill be amended in sub-clause (2) by deleting the
words "or option" appearing in paragraph (g).

38. Justifications: The Committee was of the view that the Bill should not provide voters
with other options other than approving or rejecting the referendum question. The
Committee noted providing other options to voters may complicate the referendum
voting process and will also offend Article 82(2) of the Constitution which provides that
legislation enacted by Parliament on the conduct of elections and referenda shall ensure
that the voting is simple and transparent.

39, CLAUSE 11: THAT the Bill be amended by deleting clause 1 l.

40. Justifications: The Committee noted that Clause I I of the Bill required persons
intending to campaign for or against the referendum to form one national referendum
committee and one referendum committee in every constituency. The Committee was of
the view that there is no need for the Bill to limit the number of referendum committees
which may be formed to support or oppose a referendum question. The Committee was
also of the view that requiring all persons supporting or opposing a referendum question
to form one committee was impractical to implement because people may be supporting
or opposing the referendum question for different reasons. The Committee thus resolved
that Clause 11 of the Bill be deleted.

41. CLAUSE 12: THAT the Bill be amended by deleting clause l2

42. Justifications: The Committee noted that Clause 12 of the Bill provided for the
registration of every referendum committee. The Clause also provides for the registration

31 | P a g e JLAC Report on the Referendum Bill (No. 2), 2020



of referendum leaders, chief agents and committee members. The Committee was of the
view that there is no need for the Bill to provide for the registration of referendum
committees whose lifespan is very short, probably about three months. The Committee
also noted that Clause l2(3) proposes to hold the chief agent of a referendum committee
to be responsible for the affairs of the registered referendum committee which imposes an
unfair burden on the chief agent without giving him or her the mechanisms for holding
such responsibility. The Committee thus resolved that Clause 12 of the Bill be deleted.

43. CLAUSE 13: THAT the Bill be amended by deleting clause 13

44. Justifications: The Committee noted that Clause 13 of the Bill contained contradictory
provisions. Whereas Clause l3(l) provides that each referendum committee shall bear its
own costs during its existence, Clause l3(2) provides that if public money is used to
finance a referendum. such money must be distributed equally among the registered
referendum committee. The Committee was of the view that under no circumstances
should public money be used to support or oppose a referendum question. The
Committee noted that Article 201(d) of the Constitution provides that public money shall
be used in a prudent and responsible way and spending such money to support or oppose
a referendum question would be unconstitutional. The Committee thus resolved that
Clause l3 of the Bill be deleted.

45. CLAUSE 14: THAT clause l4 of the Bill be amended by deleting sub-clause (2).

46. Justifications: The Committee was of the view that the Bill should not provide voters
with other options other than approving or rejecting the referendum question. The
Committee noted providing other options to voters may complicate the referendum
voting process and will also offend Article 82(2) of the Constitution which provides that
legislation enacted by Parliament on the conduct of elections and referenda shall ensure
that the voting is simple and transparent.

47. CLAUSE 16: THAT clause l6 of the Bill be amended-
a) in sub-clause (2) by-

(i) deleting the words "twenty eight days" appearing in paragraph (a) and
substituting thereof the words "twenty one days"; and

(ii) deleting the words "twenty eight days" appearing in paragraph (b) and
substituting thereof the words "twenty one days."

b) by deleting the words "six months" appearing in sub-clause (3) and substituting
thereof the words "thirty days."

48. Justifications: The Committee was of the view that petitions questioning the validity of a
referendum should be filed within 2l days instead of 28 days as appears in the Bill. The
Committee noted 21 days from the date of the declaration offered any potential petitioner
ample time to prepare and file their petitions. The Committee was also of the view that
referendum petitions should be concluded within 30 days of filing instead of the six
months as proposed in the Bill. The Committee noted that it is important that referendum

32 I P a g e .IL.4C Report on the ReJ'erendum Bill (r.'o. 2), 2020



petitions to be heard and determined expeditiously since they involved serious and
sensitive constitutional issues.

4r). CLAUSE 17: THAT clause l7 of the Bill be amended-
a) in sub-clause (2) by deleting paragraph (d);

b) in paragraph (3) by deleting sub-clause (3) and substituting thereof with the
following new sub-clause-

c) "(3) A referendum petition shall be heard in open court."
d) by inserting the following new sub-clauses immediately after sub-clause (3) -"(4) The High Court may, in respect of the trial of a referendum petition, exercise

such powers within its civil jurisdiction as it may deem appropriate."

"(5) A referendum petition may be withdrawn by the petitioner on notice to the

other parties and the High Court, subject to any order of the Court as to costs."

50. Justifications: The Committee resolved to delete sub-clause (3) which sets out the
grounds upon which a referendum petition may be presented. The Committee was of the
view that the grounds of the referendum petition should remain as provided for in the
Elections Act, 2071.It is also proposed that the Clause be amended to clearly stipulate
that a referendum petition shall be heard in open court.

5I.INSERTION OF NEW CLAUSE l7A: THAT, the Bill be amended by inserting the
following new clause immediately after clause 17-

Filing of a 17 A. A referendum petition shall be signed by the
referendum petitioner or by all the petitioners, if more than one.
petition.

52" Justification: The amendment seeks to clarify that a referendum petition shall be signed
by all the petitioners, if more than one

53. CLAUSE 18: THAT clause l8 of the Bill be amended-
a) in sub-clause (l) by -(i) deleting paragraph (a); and

(ii) deleting paragraph (c).
b) in sub-clause (3) by deleting the words "A petitioner" and substituting thereof

with the words "The Commission";

54. Justification: The proposal to delete paragraph (a) seeks to remove the provision
enabling a petitioner to challenge the referendum results in only one constituency. The
Committee was of the view that the referendum voting results should be challenged as a
whole in order to avoid numerous and inconsequential petitions. The Committee resolved
that it is not feasible that the Commission can be a petitioner in a referendum it conducted
and thus proposes that paragraph (c) of the clause be deleted.

33 ! P a g e JLA(. Report on the ReJerendum Bill (No. 2), 2020



55. CLAUSE 19: THAT the Bill be amended by deleting clause 19.

56. Justification: Clause 19 was found to be superfluous. The petitioners should be free to
decide who the respondents to the referendum petition should be.

57. CLAUSE 20: THAT the Bill be amended by deleting clause 20.

58. Justification: The proposed deletion of clause 20 is a consequential amendment to the
insertion of a new Clause 17A in the Bill which provides that a referendum petition shall
be signed by all the petitioners, if more than one.

59. CLAUSE 21: THAT clause 21 of the Bill be amended in sub-clause (2) by -a) deleting the words "thirty days" appearing in paragraph (a) and substituting
therefor the words "fourteen days";

b) deleting the words "six months" appearing in paragraph (b) and substituting
therefor the words "thirty days."

60. Justification: The Committee was of the view that the timelines within which an appeal
in a referendum petition must be filed in the Court of Appeal be reduced from thirty days
to fourteen days. Similarly, the Committee resolved that the appeal should be heard and
determined within thirty days instead of the six months proposed in the Bill.

61. CLAUSE 22: THAT the Bill be amended by deleting clause 22 and substituting therefor
the following new clause-

Comingtoforce. 22. (l) The Commission shall publish the result of the
referendum in the Gazette within one day of the holding of the
referendum.

(2) lf no petition is filed challenging the conduct or result of
the referendum within the time limit for making such petitions,
the result of the referendum shall be final upon the expiry of
that time limit.

(3) Where a petition is filed challenging the conduct or result
of the referendum within the time limits for filing such
petitions, the result of the referendum shall not be final until
such petitions are finally disposed of.

(4) The Commission shall, consequent upon the results of the
referendum becoming final, by notice in the Gazette confirm
the results as the final results of the referendum.

62. Justification: The amendment requires the Commission to publish the results of the
referendum within one day of holding the referendum. The amendment also seeks to
provide certainty that the results of the referendum shall not be final until any referendum
petition filed has been heard and determined by the Courts.

34 | P a g e JI,4C Report on the Referendum Bill (t\o. 2), 2020



a

63. CLAUSE 23: THAT clause 23 of the Bill be amended by deleting sub-clause (2)

64. Justification: The amendment seeks to remove the discretion conferred on the Registrar
to determine the order in which referendum petitions should be heard. The Committee
was of the view that clause 23(2) was an unnecessary encroachment on the independence

of the Courts to decide the order in which referendum petitions may be heard.

65. CLAUSE 25: THAT clause 25 of the Bill be amended-
a) by deleting the words "two or more" appearing in sub-clause (l) and substituting

therefor the words "more than one".
b) by deleting the words "under subsection (l )" appearing in clause (2).

6(i. Justification: This amendment seeks to clarify that where there are more than one
petitioners and some petitioners die before the final determination of the petition, the
surviving petitioners are entitled to continue with the petition.

67. INSERTION OF NEW CLAUSE 25A: THAT, the Bill be amended by inserting the
following new clause immediately after clause 25-

Joinder of 25A. (l) A court hearing a referendum petition
interested parties. may, upon application allow, the joinder of amicus

curiae and other interested parties.

(2) The Court shall before allowing the joinder of
amicus curiae or other interested parties, take into
consideration the public interest, the expertise,
independence and impartiality of the person in
question or any other relevant factors.

68. Justification: The amendment seeks to empower a court hearing a referendum petition to
allow the joinder of amicus curiae and other interested parties, taking into consideration
the public interest, the expertise of the applicants and any other relevant factors.

69. CLAUSE 30: THAT clause 30 of the Bill be amended-
a) by deleting sub-clause (2);
b) by deleting sub-clause (3);
c) by deleting sub-clause (4);
d) by deleting sub-clause (5);

Justifications

a) The proposed deletion of sub-clause (2) seeks to remove the powers of the High
Court to declare a referendum void for contravention of the Act or the

Regulations. The Committee was of the view that a referendum should only be

nullified on known and pleaded grounds and not on general grounds as proposed

in sub-clause (2).

35 lP age JLA('Reporton the ReJerendum Bill (.No.2),2020



b) The proposed deletion of sub-clauses (3) and (4) removes administrative
procedures by the Registrar of the High Court from the Bill. Issues relating to the

delivery of a certified copy of the decision by the High Court to the Commission
need not be legislated upon.

c) The proposed deletion of sub-clause (5) seeks to uphold the right of a petitioner to
appeal to the Court of Appeal as provided for in Clause 2l of the Bill.

70. CLAUSE 31: THAT clause 3l of the Bill be amended in sub-clause (3) be deletingthe
words "which may be made upon motion after notice and proof that alljust claims have
been satisfied or otherwise sufficiently provided for as the High Court may require"
appearing immediately after the word "the High Court." where it first appears.

Tl.Justification: The amendment seeks to delete superfluous and ambiguous words in
Clause 3l(3) of the Bill which provides for reimbursement of money deposited as

security for costs.

72. CLAUSE 32: THAT clause 32 of the Bill be amended in sub-clause (2) be deleting the
word "report" appearing immediately after the words "Upon receipt of the" and
substituting therefor the word'Judgement".

73. Justification: The amendment seeks to clarify that the Director of Public Prosecutions
should take action after receiving the "Judgement" of the court rather than the "Report"
contemplated in sub-clause (l).

74. CLAUSE 68: THAT the Bill be amended by deleting clause 68

75. Justification: The amendment seeks to rescind the proposed repeal of section 104 of the
Elections Act, 201l.The Committee noted that the section provides for the facilitation of
persons with special needs to realize their right to vote and should be retained in the
Elections Act, 201 1.

I

I

35 ! P a g e JI-A(. Report on the Referendum Bill (i\io. 2), 2020



CHAPTER FIVE

5.0 COMMITTEE RECOMMENDATION

76. The Committee having facilitated public participation and considered the
Referendum (No.2) Bill,2020 recommends to the House that the Referendum (No.2)
Bill, 2020 (National Assembly Bill No.14) should be proceeded with, subject to the
inclusion of the amendments proposed in Chapter four of this Report.

Signed Date. t{ ( 6 2A"a

Hon. Muturi Kieano. M.P.

Chairperson. Denartmental Committee on Justice and Lesal Affairs

I
I

37 I P a g e JL,AC Report on the Referendum Bill (No. 2), 2020



(

ANEEXURE 1

MINUTES

j

I



- r- t , ,

4 3-

MINI-ITES OF THE THIRTIETH SITTING OF THE DEPARTMENTAL COMMITTEE ON
JUSTICE AND LEGAL AFFAIRS HELD ON FRIDAY 9THOCTOBER.2O2O AT IO:OO AM IN
WELDONE ROOM. TAMARIND VILLAGE HOTEL. MOMBASA

PRESENT
l. Hon. Clement Muturi Kigano, M.P. - Chairperson
2. Hon. John Olago Aluoch, M.P.
3. l{on. Peter Opondo Kaluma, M.P.
4. Hon. William K. Mwamkale, M.P
5. I-lon. Zuleikha Hassan, M.P.
6. FIon. Robert Gichimu Githinji, M.P
7. Ilon. Adan Haji Yussuf, M.P
8. I-lon. Jennifer Shamalla, M.P.
9. Hon. George G. Murugara, M.P
10. [{on. Anthony G. Kiai, M.P.
I l. [{on. Japheth Mutai, M.P.
12. IIon. Anthony Oluoch, M.P.
13. Hon. John M. Wambugu, M.P.
14. Hon. John Kiarie Waweru, M.P.

ABSENT WITH APOLOGIES
l. FIon. (Dr.) Paul Otiende Amollo, M.P
2. Flon. Junet Sheikh Nuh Mohamed, M.P
3. Hon. Emmanuel Wangwe, M.P.
4. FIon. Roselinda Soipan Tuya, M.P.
5. Hon. Josephine Naisula Lesuuda, M.P.

Vice Chairperson

IN ATTENDANCE.
l. Abenayo Wasike
2. Mr.Denis Abisai
3. Mr. Ahmed Odhowa
4. Ms. Halima Hussein

5. Ms. Roselyn Ndegi

MIN No.02l2020:-
Agenda was deferred.

COMMITTEE SECRETARIAT.MT.
Senior Clerk Assistant

Principal Legal Counsel

Principal Research Officer
Second Clerk Assistant
Sergeant At Arms

CONFIRMATION OF MINUTES

MIN No.0l/2020:- PRELIMINARIES
The meeting commenced at 10:00 am with a word of prayer from Chairperson and the program was
adopted as filed.

t



rt

MIN No.03/2020:- CONSIDERATION AND ADOPTION OF THE REPORT ON THE
REFERENDUM NO.2) NATIONAL BILL NO.14 OF 2O2O

The Commiftee considered and unanimously adopted its report on the Referendum Bill, 2020 (National

Assembly Bill No.) with the following recommendations. The adoption was proposed by Hon. William
Kamotiand seconded by Hon. Wambugu Munene.

CLAUSE 2: THAT the Bill be amended in clause 2 by deleting the expression "Cabinet Secretary." to
clean up the Bill because the term "Cabinet Secretary" is not used in the Bill.

CLAUSE 5: THAT clause 5 of the Bill be amended in sub-clause (3) by deleting the words "after the

date it was submitted by the Commission" appearing in paragraph (c) and by deleting the expression "for"
appearing in sub-clause ( 10). The proposed amendment was meant to clarifo that the Commission should

submit the Draft Bill to each county assembly within three months of verifying that the Bill meets the

requirements of Article 257 of the Constitution.

CLAUSE 7: THAT the Bill be amended by deleting clause 7. The Committee was of the view that it is
not necessary to provide for local referenda in the Bill. The local referenda may be held under Section 90

of the County Governments Act, No.l7 of 2012, as currently provided for.

CLAUSE 8: THAT the Bill be amended by deleting clause 8. The Committee was of the view that it is
not necessary to provide for other referenda in the Bill. The Bill should be restricted to provide for the

referenda contempl ated under the Con stituti on.

CLAUSE 9: THAT clause 9 of the Bill be amended-

in sub-clause ( I ) by deleting the words "or option" appearing immediately after the word "question"
appearing in the closing paragraph;

in sub-clause (2) by deleting the words "or option, refer the question or option to the relevant House for
approval" and substituting therefor the words "refer the question to the Houses of Parliament for
approval".;
in sub-clause (3) by deleting the words "or option" appearing immediately after the word "question";
in sub-clause (a) by deleting the words "or option" wherever it appears;

in sub-clause (5) by deleting the words "or option" appearing at the end of the sub-clause;

in sub-clause (6) by deleting the words "or option" wherever it appears;

in sub-clause (7) by deleting the words "or option" wherever it appears;

in sub-clause (8) by deleting the words "or option" wherever it appears;

in sub-clause (9) by deleting the words "or option" appearing immediately after the word "question",
in sub-clause ( I 0) by deleting the word "option" wherever it appears and substituting therefor the word
"question";

in sub-clause (l I ) by deleting the words "or option" appearing immediately after the word "question";

The Committee was of the view that the Commission should not provide voters with other options other
than approving or rejecting the referendum question.

2



-t- { r

The Committee noted that providing other options to voters may complicate the referendum voting
process and will also offend Article 82(2) of the Constitution which provides that Iegislation enacted by
Parliament on the conduct of elections and referenda shall ensure that the voting is simple and

transparent.

The proposed amendment to sub-clause (2) also sought to remedy the ambiguity in the provision caused

by the use of the term "relevant House". The amendment clarifies that the question shall be referred to
both Houses of Parliament for approval.

CLAUSE 10: THAT clause l0 of the Bill be amended in sub-clause (2) by deleting the words "or
option" appearing in paragraph (g).

The Committee was of the view that the Bill should not provide voters with other options other than

approving or rejecting the referendum question. The Committee noted providing other options to voters
may complicate the referendum voting process and will also offend Article 82(2) of the Constitution
which provides that legislation enacted by Parliament on the conduct of elections and referenda shall
ensure that the voting is simple and transparent.

CLAUSE Il: THAT the Bill be amended by deleting clause I L
The Committee noted that Clause I I of the Bill required persons intending to campaign for or against the
referendum to form one national referendum committee and one referendum committee in every
constituency. The Committee was of the view that there is no need for the Bill to limit the number of
referendum committees which may be formed to support or oppose a referendum question. The
Committee was also of the view that requiring all persons supporting or opposing a referendum question
to form one committee was impractical to implement because people may be supporting or opposing the
referendum question for different reasons. The Committee thus resolved that Clause I I of the Bill be

deleted.

CLAUSE 12: THAT the Bill be amended by deleting clause 12.

The Committee noted that Clause l2 of the Bill provided for the registration of every referendum
committee. The Clause also provides for the registration of referendum leaders, chief agents and
committee members. The Committee was of the view that there is no need for the Bill to provide for the
registration of referendum committees whose lifespan is very short, probably about three months. The
Committee also noted that Clause l2(3) proposes to hold the chief agent of a referendum committee to be

responsible for the affairs of the registered referendum committee which imposes an unfair burden on the
chief agent without giving him or her the mechanisms for holding such responsibility. The Committee
thus resolved that Clause l2 of the Bill be deleted.

CLAUSE 13: THAT the Bill be amended by deleting clause l3

The Committee noted that Clause l3 of the Billcontained contradictory provisions. Whereas Clause l3(l)
provides that each referendum committee shall bear its own costs during its existence, Clause l3(2)
provides that if public money is used to finance a referendum, such money must be distributed equally
among the registered referendum committee. The Committee was of the view that under no circumstances

3



t t 'l-

should public money be used to support or oppose a referendum question. The Committee noted that

Article 201(d) of the Constitution provides that public money shall be used in a prudent and responsible

way and spending such money to support or oppose a referendum question would be unconstitutional.
The Committee thus resolved that Clause l3 of the Bill be deleted.

CLAUSE 14: THAT clause l4 of the Bill be amended by deleting sub-clause (2)

The Committee was of the view that the Bill should not provide voters with other options other than

approving or rejecting the referendum question. The Committee noted providing other options to voters

may complicate the referendum voting process and will also offend Article 82(2) of the Constitution
which provides that legislation enacted by Parliament on the conduct of elections and referenda shall

ensure that the voting is simple and transparent.

CLAUSE 16: THAT clause 16 of the Bill be amended-

a) in sub-clause (2) by-
(i) deleting the words "twenty eight days" appearing in paragraph (a) and

substituting thereof the words "twenty one days"; and
(ii) deleting the words "twenty eight days" appearing in paragraph (b) and

substituting thereof the words "twenty one days."
b) by deleting the words "six months" appearing in sub-clause (3) and substituting thereof

the words "thirty days."
The Committee was of the view that petitions questioning the validity of a referendum should be filed
within 2l days instead of 28 days as appears in the Bill. The Committee noted 2l days from the date of
the declaration offered any potential petitioner ample time to prepare and file their petitions. The
Committee was also of the view that referendum petitions should be concluded within 30 days of filing
instead of the six months as proposed in the Bill. The Committee noted that it is important that
referendum petitions to be heard and determined expeditiously since they involved serious and sensitive
constitutional issues.

CLAUSE 17: THAT clause l7 of the Bill be amended-
a) in sub-clause (2) by deleting paragraph (d);

b) in paragraph (3) by deleting sub-clause (3) and substituting thereof with the following
new sub-clause-

c) "(3) A referendum petition shall be heard in open court."
d) by inserting the following new sub-clauses immediately after sub-clause (3) -"(4) The High Court may, in respect of the trial of a referendum petition, exercise such

powers within its civiljurisdiction as it may deem appropriate."

"(5) A referendum petition may be withdrawn by the petitioner on notice to the other
parties and the High Court, subject to any order of the Court as to costs."

The Committee resolved to delete sub-clause (3) which sets out the grounds upon which a referendum
petition may be presented. The Committee was of the view that the grounds of the referendum petition
should remain as provided for in the Elections Act,2011.lt is also proposed that the Clause be amended to
clearly stipulate that a referendum petition shall be heard in open court.

INSERTION OF NEW CLAUSE l7A: THAT, the Bill be amended by inserting the following new
clause immediately after clause l7-

4



I

Filing of a 17 A. A referendum petition shall be signed by the
referendum petition. petitioner or by allthe petitioners, if more than one.

The amendment seeks to clari$r that a referendum petition shall be signed by all the petitioners, if more
than one
CLAUSE 18: THAT clause l8 of the Billbe amended-

a) in sub-clause (l) by -(i) deleting paragraph (a); and
(ii) deleting paragraph (c).

b) in sub-clause (3) by deleting the words "A petitioner" and substituting thereof with the
words "The Commission";

The proposal to delete paragraph (a) seeks to remove the provision enabling a petitioner to challenge the
referendum results in only one constituency. The Committee was of the view that the referendum voting
results should be challenged as a whole in order to avoid numerous and inconsequential petitions. The
Committee resolved that it is not feasible that the Commission can be a petitioner in a referendum it
conducted and thus proposes that paragraph (c) ofthe clause be deleted.

CLAUSE 19: THAT the Bill be amended by deleting clause 19.

Clause 19 was found to be superfluous. The petitioners should be free to decide who the respondents to
the referendum petition should be.

CLAUSE 20: THAT the Bill be amended by deleting clause 20.

The proposed deletion of clause 20 is a consequential amendment to the insertion of a new Clause 17 A in
the Bill which provides that a referendum petition shall be signed by all the petitioners, if more than one.

CLAUSE 21: THAT clause 2l of the Billbe amended in sub-clause (2) by-
a) deleting the words "thirq/ days" appearing in paragraph (a) and substituting therefor the

words "fourteen days";
b) deleting the words "six months" appearing in paragraph (b) and substituting therefor the

words "thirty days."
The Committee was of the view that the timelines within which an appeal in a referendum petition must
be filed in the Court of Appeal be reduced from thirty days to fourteen days. Similarly, the Committee
resolved that the appeal should be heard and determined within thirty days instead of the six months
proposed in the Bill.

CLAUSE 222 TH/IT the Bill be amended by deleting clause 22 and substituting therefor the following
new clause-

Coming to force. 22. (l) The Commission shall publish the result of the referendum in
the Cazette within one day of the holding of the referendum.

(2) If no petition is filed challenging the conduct or result of the
referendum within the time limit for making such petitions, the result
of the referendum shall be final upon the expiry of that time limit.

(3) Where a petition is filed challenging the conduct or result of the
referendum within the time limits for filing such petitions, the result
of the referendum shall not be final until such petitions are finally
disposed of.

5



(4) The Commission shall, consequent upon the results of the
referendum becoming final, by notice in the Gazette confirm the
results as the final results of the referendum.

The amendment requires the Commission to publish the results of the referendum within one day of
holding the referendum. The amendment also seeks to provide certainty that the results of the referendum
shall not be final until any referendum petition filed has been heard and determined by the Courts.

CLAUSE 23: THAT clause 23 of the Bill be amended by deleting sub-clause (2).

The amendment seeks to remove the discretion conferred on the Registrar to determine the order in which
referendum petitions should be heard. The Commiftee was of the view that clause 23(2) was an
unnecessary encroachment on the independence of the Courts to decide the order in which referendum
petitions may be heard.

CLAUSE 25: THAT clause 25 of the Bill be amended-
a) by deleting the words "two or more" appearing in sub-clause (1) and substituting

therefor the words "more than one".
b) by deleting the words "under subsection ( I )" appearing in clause (2).

This amendment seeks to clarify that where there are more than one petitioners and some petitioners die
before the final determination of the petition, the surviving petitioners are entitled to continue with the
petition.

INSERTION OF NEW CLAUSE 25A: THAT, the Bill be amended by inserting the following new
clause immediately after clause 25-

Joinder of interested 25A. (l) A court hearing a referendum petition may,
parties. upon application allow, the joinder of amicus curiae and

other interested parties.

(2) The Court slrall before allowing the joinder of
amicus curiae or other interested parties, take into
consideration the public interest, the expeftise,
independence and impartiality of the person in question
or any other relevant factors.

The amendment seeks to empower a court hearing a referendum petition to allow the joinder of amicus
curiae and other interested parties, taking into consideration the public interest, the expertise of the
applicants and any other relevant factors.

CLAUSE 30: THAT clause 30 of the Bill be amended-
a) by deleting sub-clause (2);
b) by deleting sub-clause (3);
c) by deleting sub-clause (4);
d) by deleting sub-clause (5);

The proposed deletion of sub-clause (2) seeks to remove the powers of the High Court to declare a

referendum void for contravention of the Act or the Regulations. The Committee was of the view that a

referendum should only be nullified on known and pleaded grounds and not on general grounds as

proposed in sub-clause (2).

5



The proposed deletion of sub-clauses (3) and (4) removes administrative procedures by the Registrar of
the High Court from the Bill. Issues relating to the delivery of a certified copy of the decision by the High
Court to the Commission need not be legislated upon.

The proposed deletion of sub-clause (5) seeks to uphold the right of a petitioner to appeal to the Court of
Appealas provided for in Clause 2l of the Bill.

CLAUSE 3l: THAT clause 3l of the Bill be amended in sub-clause (3) be deleting the words "which
may be made upon motion after notice and proof that all just claims have been satisfied or otherwise
sufficiently provided for as the High Court may require" appearing immediately after the word "the High
Court." where it first appears.

The amendment seeks to delete superfluous and ambiguous words in Clause 3l(3) of the Bill which
provides for reimbursement of money deposited as security for costs.

CLAUSE 32: THAT clause 32 of the Bill be amended in sub-clause (2) be deleting the word "report"
appearing immediately after the words "Upon receipt of the" and substituting therefor the word
"judgement".

The amendment seeks to clarify that the Director of Public Prosecutions should take action after receiving
the "Judgement" of the court rather than the "Report" contemplated in sub-clause ( I ).

CLAUSE 68: THAT the Bill be amended by deleting clause 68.

The amendment seeks to rescind the proposed repeal of section 104 of the Elections Act, 20ll.The
Committee noted that the section provides for the facilitation of persons with special needs to realize their
right to vote and should be retained in the Elections Act, 201 l.

MIN No.04/2020: ANY OTHER BUSINESS
No matter arose

MIN No. 0412020: ADJOURNMENT
Tlrere being no other business to transact, the meeting was adjourned at I : lOpm

Signed

o"t...[s{$2x..

7



!



t. a

ANEEXURE 2

ADOPTTON LTST

l,\r,.'t'



I

KENYA NATIONAL ASSEMBLY

DEPARTMENTAL CON{MITTEE ON JUSTICE AND LEGAL AFFAIRS

ATTENDAI{CE REGISTER FOR MEMBERS

/fvrLAct l.q 8-.,

a

DATE. . .3 J.,.ri I . *.-.,i,p-...... srART TrME . . i. u o0 {'' TIME..
(1u

VENUB....L .i::: l'1.*;.1. l\t \ rL-i t\-(ri--

AGENDA...hg: utl

(- P.=P,5 (q I
&rtJ +.1?'h?).\n^^

t.

NO.

Hon. Peter Opondo Kaluma, MP

i i,'-',,. llcselir.tia So ipan Tuya, MP.

Hor.. Mwamkale Kanioti, MP

Hon. Zuleikha Hassan, MP

0.

I
Hon. Josephine Naisula Lesuuda, M.P.

t.

t.

NAME SIFNATURE
Hon. Clement Muturi Kigano, M.P. -Chairperson (l/ln ,/ frt,
Hon. (D..) Paul Otiende Amollo, M.P -Vice-
Chairperson
Hon. Emmanuel Wangwe, M.P

Hon. Junet Sheikh Nuh Mohamed, M.P

Hon. John Olago Aluoch, MP.

a
/'f\ 4

r,^r-F--

\_---

Hon. George Gitonga Murugara, MP. Gln f "'1a .{--v



I

12.

t-J

14.

L.*r

16.

18.

19.

Hon. Adan Haji Yussuf, MP.

Hon. Anthony Githiaka Kiai, MP

Hon. Jennifer Shamalla, Mi

COMMITTEE CLERK

\.

tt
I

.}(
I

7r

7
Hon. Japheth Kiplangat Mutai, MP.

Hon. John Kiarie Waweru, MP. \<_T

17. Hon. John Munene Wambugu, MP

Hon. Anthony Oluoch, M.P.

Hon. Robert Gichimu Githinji, M.P



ANEEXURE 3

N EWSPAPER ADVERTISEM ENT



DATL\J NATION I Tuesday, Iune 3o, zor,o

REPUBLTC OF KENYA

ffi
ol 2Ol8)

*ffi*rll*

i**t;*i*-,*u,*#"-*,meil*i.,nmffin,nill###ml,r.,*
:l*iffi ,Iil,1,S:rei,ll^[*.HHil'i1." 5fi ,*".I13.,,1,1,,.!""i,:ll3:.?,rfl 

"ril:,.fl ,l, ?:#;

l'Jl" -*!itfitx.;:ffixllil,?_.,,*i&::fi,.1fh n-,*il,ji{:flflj.[

n";1fldff #drf J:r#jl#lkr$ii.illii:Sd$.,"r,s'ffiri:r?rx.:hi?:;
.."".Ti1i1L1;,'11,TJ,IL.,,..,

Th $hool lnvltr! btdt fm ththt.d rd glstbt. btddor/T:tmr ftj 611ry611q1 md .flhptlu o, Strh dormttory

#ffi,.ff J"[Hfl]i"q#ir,mHH:l#:;:ffi [s,:,*",r.,:il1"h*mffHjiilffi 
1,,,ti11,ffi

Ntlurto Lul6y prtmry SclEl b t A.6ltc Sch@l h $ry! Ward ol Nrot trrt Coo0th,Ey.

ln !dd[too.
.)
b)
c)
d)
.)
0
rl
h)

qrdarbbo httx hrt

Copy olEtpt

ffii:tlffiffi hd'ln nLd mbp'a clrlv Dil.d rnh ri. Gp.crvt rndr Numbr, d.srrpthn

Ilt tLd*hr.frtlct*;yfrhai*-r-rourqao+rirmnr'

ff .ltffi 15,'ffi iI;,#ffi #,ffi r,iffiffiH[,lffi :,"dntimdtrrt*.
ru(um! tumnY PEIA|IY 3ct501

l. N.LP.S/llzors&o Proporrd mrtructbn
otlld! dmttqy

rd.qulppln! oprr

SUBMISSION F MEMORANDA

,JC-']u.,. [\Ct;J-

t7

REPUBLIC OF KETIYA

ffi

ffii$pgg$1rgffitgh1rffig[":,#$ffi

(N.Uonrl

Tha Brlbary Act (No. .U ot 2016) -16 of

Nq

tllrhtr Act (No. t4 ot

:No.

rl.

t.

t.

ii!E:rr#irilr*i#fl:l]#il,f i#1,,H::i,r",",ri,
Th. L.rderuhlD.nd lntegrlty Act (No, t9 0f ,:Ol2) _rn. Kony! Llw R.torm Cohmt$ton Act (No. t9;,2Ol3)
jllrcortt ot acpcrr 1or!!nlsluon & Admlntrtntton-l-aii <No. :a o,

ACI TO IE AilENO:O

N.tlml bcurlty
I

8 ot 2OlO)
(No. 30 ot

?ha
Th.
The
Th.

2OX)

I Nrtloilt

act (C.p.

14 ot

Plrnntp

Act
The

of a

I

The Unlvar!ltlat (No.Act ol42 2012'

Fllms and St.g. Pt.yr Act (c!p. 222)

No. 15 ot.2OOB)
Prelld.nt a O.stgn.bd

4 ot 2006)

Stlta

(No.Act of 20t5)
& ofThc Publlc ActHolldryl lo9)

a Sclrl

A.blk

t

Scr!p M.tal act (No. I of 2ol5)
lod{tt:, I

a LO'.l

H,ff [:,"i!t'$iJH,f *HIif"H jl,'J;l 
"iH.'i;,F$L#lT,ii*,ifi ,il,?f ;om, ned to clart@p.rll.mnllE.h; to b! Gdwd on tr b.t\on llild.r, C. &ly, lOlO il S:oO

t{tcHAIL n.3tAUl. EE3
crEnx or txr ntrtorer tsirxery



\-... i * ',.J t-' ,',.i '' ( C-'

fn"iatrh.* 3
F

Tuesday,lun€ 30,2020 THE-STAE,CO.KE

ilffi$$ElttRlt

rc0toiltc cRIHrS I8r

EACC probes couple over unex.prained wealth and assets of sh600m ln fiv,e years

Former KRA manager arrested
over Sh38.7 million tax evasion

MOSE OOH t{'to
OIh.St-XlDi

The DrNca end And-Corrupdon
Commlsslon ycsterdey emsted e
fomer lop KnA mmgcr for tl-
le8edly sdlng trx mountlng to
Sh3g.z multon.

Thc antl-Bmn agency has also
bcf, ttesdget nS ,crph GlkonlD
mr ucplslned wslth md ssctg
of rbout Sh6oO milllotr Io firc )Eu.

CEO'lwrllb Mbatd( tn astttcmcnt
$ld thc (tmmi$toq his bcm prob-
lng thc fomq Kn[ omctsl dong-
sldc hir wlfc hcy tbqgrl ud thdr
crmpary trcdlng.r clche Llnxlted.

The probe rertaled that the oto-
cer - who ls the dtrctor of Glche
Llmttcd, sd hls wlfc - scrmulet.d
tlrc u.tehlned Ncts lrtwren 2O1O

ud 2015.
'A c,vll slt ws flhd at the An-

tlcorruptton snd Ecrnomic Crtmes
Dlvision of the HlSi Crurt for for-

fcttue of the rsts.' thc atrtemcni
rcads-

Dtcctor o( Publlc Prcsecuflons
Noordln tftrl gnntert EACC mnrent
to fusl Dmsecutc the tw) on thc tr:(
mslon chage.

nrcy wlu be chrrged wlth con-
tnEnlng taxotlon law as tell aj
vloladon of Uts And-Compfion and
E@nomlc Crimes Act.

'The suspectc wlu bc arrelgned
todiy to tckr pler,' T\mltb s.td tn
the strtctmt to the prcss.lhe KRA
mgd'! rmst csre brrcly deyr
after lhc EACE succtsfully pro-
cuted Slrtilr MPJoh,lV,lrlulrr mr c
Sh30o mlluon tnud nt the Nrlronil
Ccred! end ttoduc Bfitd.

'Ihe laflmks Nxl hls 6-.mrd
Gnm tihkhungu 

rarcre hmded 6?
)'ea:s and 69 yesrs ln ,nll resptc-
ttEly. The agcn.y lnmcd of mor,:
hlgh-prcf.le c!N'tctlons.

Whlulc': cse cmrc ln thc ..nkc
of the slat? lrolsterlrg the antlgmn
flglrt rvlth a prcposel lvbJch teclut-
cally speG3 only I slttlng prsldent

,M I prcseoltlon for gnft.
'rl c gmrment hs put trcfore

[trl ament r proposl whlch ri,ou.ld
rcqr lEcllrt t?ornelrchrgedwlth .l

gnl j to hcf,tc omcc for et lcst trc
-}!{t.

'll e ain?ndnenB to ACEGA arc
con:olned ln the Statutcs Law
(Ar sdmcnt) BUl,2020, whlch lr
rt tJ c snunlttee str8c.

E .CC hs rcstrted tlEt lt wtll tror
trle { ln thc nght.grtBt corrup.don
and uncthtcd conduct, moE so try
pub t! ;J strte om(tE.

'A c.car dcmonstraflon of lbls,s
s'h( rc r€ hilr! lftgted $atc ud
pub tc o0lcen lrltslrcttE olthe
pos tlons thcy hold,' Dr Daber
Mu lm sald-

Ir hlsaddress ro r.rirhral tnlntng
of C )rnlpilon nrclrntlon Colmlr
tees )f lh. Uniwrs,ty of Ntlrobl, the
sm :llselcner sked put llc offlm
lo a( hcrc to the )ow gmmlng thck
\wr i

''Il re mr agalnst comptlon rnst

Joscph GllqrF .mrt

8trrtfrorn t}c op.n(l t'e srtended
md fclt at sU l,rub of orrr soclety,"
h: $ld.

'The hlues enshrlncd ln ChaDter
Srr of l}le Conctthdon shonldbe tn-
cu.lcrted ln lhc mrnds md denon-
stntrd,n the a(tlom and behrvlou
of stl stefi.'

l*

'l,ls 
n E0YIRlt0R'$ Pttss llltlI

Journallst Kemel
succumbsto
asthma attack
3trr rD*ltr/ A Jilna[st ylorkh8
ior l(trlcho Mty t6[rm!rt dad
on Sunday atter en acuh attack of
asthma.

Imothy fcmcltvas a Nathn
M.dla GDt.p sEsporldG?t h th.
cotffty bcloru h.Johld th! 8mr-
nors'pEss unlt rs r dlnctor.

Hc dled on ardv.l at S[orIIl
Hospltd ln lQrlcho toxn whcc ha
msrushadbyHildlldDr hthe
pGss sewlce L.onad lork tlom Nt
rrsldmcc ln lcrldlo.

JournallsB mowned fcmd sayhg
thc county had lost a h.rd-mrktng
Joumalln.

Ihc scrbc halls{lom Fort Temil
ln Klpkellon WEst constthrncy,
l&rlcho.

An orphan, f€mel starEd hts
ch[dhood cdEdon.t Bahd Chi-
drff's HDm? ln Londatlh Klpkeflon
East ostlturncy.

H!.ttcnded Kertcho Htth School
for hls se@ndary cdu@flon.

Itc laterJolned E8€rton UnlwBlty
where he Sraduated wth a bache-
lor's degEe ln communlGdon.

Hls t ody ls at Slloam Hospltal
mortuary pendlng burlal arrange-
ments.

.t
t.
H

j

Macharia at pains to expla,in
new construction rcgulati ons

PtlALlt P[flIlClPfiIil,]l

AtLAr xEu/ Tnnsport CS ,mes
Mrch8rla lrcsterdsy stnggled 10
colMna mton that vlex,s of the
publlc rcrc hcorponted tn the Na-
tlonal Comtrucdon Authorlty (Dc-
hcls UrblXdca) R(tsuhdoB, 2020.

Mecharle apperred beforc tbe
Scmte's Roeds nnd TEnrport CDm-
mlttee wher! hc seld N3 mfdfiy
hcld dlscusslons wlth lnsdtudotr
ln the crnsftrcdon lndustry dudng
thc formuledon of the rcguhdoru.

HfiIer cr, mmrnltte dltk Klmrnt
Whmatrngt ldd the medngr csutd
hilc bcm csrvencd cxclusfiEly for
prcfdslond bodle! rnd not necrs-
srily for wnanchl.

'lrvhs therc pubuc pcrddp.don?
lf lt w! thc, !^,u lt ed€qute? Whs
there u sdrcrt ln the locrl deltes
tnvtthSpcoplc to glltvl6^rs on Ure
rcguhuon ?' trlhmtcngt sskrd.

Mm SmtorMtthtkr Ltnturl eld

i
h

! wmchl hlrc ben clmplalnlnE
tlut thcy'ftrr nm consrlted t e-
foE the Egurruons wrc grzetted.
'We mnt the minlstry to qphtn
how the rcguledoro re erlccted
wlthot followlng duc pms.'

the CS, hm, said his mlnts-
try held nEedngs wtth lnsUtudoN
lest)E[,nDc$mb€rwhmltw
fomuletlng t}te rcguhdoN.

'Wc had mectlngs wlth th€ Er-
los hstltutlon! md I bcIcrE thcy
Eprrsented e bmnd s?ectrum of
strkcholden,' he srtd.

'lhe Netlond CoBtructlon Au-
thortty (De& Uebutty) Regule-
Um tnEodued e defmts UabUlty
perlod for clmmerclal bulldlngs
thst giE3 meF up to s6/!n yeers
to mdl contrtc{oF to t}re sltes for
rEcflncetions. Tne defccts' lhbury
pcrlod m dso lncrcded to 8 mln-
tIllmof Umonths.

REPUBLIC OF KENYA

ffi
NATIONAL ASSEMBLY

TWELFTH PARLIAMENT - FOURTH SESSION

ln Oi. m.tun C orld.rrdco It tlla lhorlaa Al.ilfllD
l.l1i. i.tilds,i O{.r) llt tfrd..r.lAsOt, il*araC:OAO!
2. Th. Csnt, [.w Cmdl.m .rd Eafoc.m.nt OII (S.iltr llll Ncz! oa 2Ot !t

Ih! .bm m.ntlqrd lllh htn

Artlclc I rE(r xb) of thc connftutron pwrdct rh.!'p.rlhm.nt thlll ficilltrtc publrc Frdcrpaflonud lnvolErcnt ln thc bgtlhthn rnd othcr bu{ne!! of p.ilhmot .nd lA Commttta6: Furthrr,
thr Natlon.l turmbly Stlndlng Cdq l2I(31 pBld6 rh.!.th. DGp.rtmnlll Cmmttto to
whl€h . Blll It cmmltt({ rh.ll t dllrtG publl( p.nktp.tbo rnd t.kr 6to r@nt thc vlcs and
rccommad.tlos of tha publtc wh( o thG Commmre mkq nt Epon to th. Hou$:

Th.Count, LlrCoriplbnoltd !n oEn.trrllll (t.ilrall0tao 2tCfOf ll tclrtopDvlda
for tha art bllrhmnt ot hw olbcelmt rnd tnlpGtmtr unltt ln o<h @nty ind to prq,tdr fo.
thc rdmlnl*illon md mnrgmil of thc unltr tunhd, h wlll prwtdr nor r icgrt frrrirm* tor
th! lppolntmcnt funcrlont tnd I uiltom code ot conduci for thc mfffiat;fics to mtur
ompllrncc wlth l.u cnactld byCc untyArrcmbilcr.

,trndr (mmtncd to thc Dapannr
lnd thcHfts Eport tothc Houtr.

onJudlaand

tatc!{AEL r.slaltlErs
cl.Enx oF?Ht il^rlof,lt lS3ttBLY

Chds 127(!) .nd
iot (firldmtlon

PuEurntlothGpbvltlonrofArtl:k fittflXb)otth.ConrtttuilonrndSrtndtngOrdrl2T(3),th.
Commlne lnvlt.r lntcn*ld mmb rtr of th! publtc to rubmlt tny rcpnnnbti-on: thcy mey irrn
on th. rld 8lllt. Thc Slllr on b! tr Ged frm thc prrlhmntrry icbrltr rt mi.ril;iol
oofr/trr.flildl.@il5rt/tre -t rrn.fi /brrr&

lha rcpEsantatlonr o? wtttcn tubml$lonr mry ba formrdrd to tht Ch* ol th. Irtlonrl
Arr.6b1y, P,o. lq /tt!a2{Oloo, ilrlrobti h.nd.d.llw(d to th. olllo o, lh. Chrli malnP.dllmntlulldlnts XdEbl, q mllhd ro.t 'tapdlrdail-tah.to br n(.hnd on oibafoG
Mond.,, 6rh Jirt, 2020 rt t.Oo pm.

I
I-....-

lIrN )on Cs
Jam..lrachvla
/nl'i



I

ANEEXURE 4

STAKEHOLDERS SU BM ISSIONS



a

pynwt^a q.
,

@ ozrr aor sro I Q tnfo@kcpf.or,kc
lnfo.kcpf0gmall.com

I O www.kcpf.or.ke
14945 - 00800 Nslrobl, K.nya
Waumlnl Hous.(N€w) Sth Floor,
Walyakl Way, W.stl.nd5

o

KCPF
KEHYA C}IRISTIA}| PROFE8AIOMLS FORUM

Tuesday, 21 July 2o2o

Mr. Mlchael R. Slalal
Clerk of the Natlonal Assembly
Parliament Buildings.

P.O Box 4182 ooloo
Nalrobl, Kenya.

KIMOSOP

SECREIARY

U*;e IlLs
Dear Sir,

BE ELIHE-EEF-ER E ND UI4 B ltl-z o 20. A N D TH E .BE FE R E N D-U-M B I LL (N Q.z) z.o 1o

The Kenya Christian Professionals Forum (KCPF) brings together Christian Professionals from various
denominations sharlng common values on Life, Family, Religion, Value- Based education and
Governance. We provide professional and technical support ln influencing the development of a legal
and social environment that is supportive of biblicalvalues. Our key partners are the Kenya Conference

of Catholic Bishops (KCCB), National Council of Churches of Kenya (NCCK) and the EvangelicalAlliance

of Kenya (EAK).

Attached to this letter, kindly find our concerns on the Referendum Bill :ozo and the Referendum Bill
(No.z) 2o2o Bill, zotg and our Memorandum.

Y rs Sincerely, NATIO N }iI, A$ [i[h{ D I, Y

IEGIE[IVIg

)r[]r-a

':i?,1

Cc

[-l ' ,,

CL}IF.I{'S OF}TTCB
P. O. Box 418t2,liit\tR()l3f IChalrperson,

Constitutlonal lmplementation Committee.
Parliament Buildings.
P.O Box 4r8z ooroo
Nalrobi, Kenya.

Chairperson,
Departmental Committee on Justice & LegalAffairs
Parliament Buildings.
P.O Box 4r8z ooroo
Nairobi, Kenya.



a



I

MEMORANDUM TO THE NATIONAL ASSEMBLY

ON

THE REFERENDUM BILL zozo AND THE REFERENDUM BILL (NO.z) 2o2o

Presented by

Kenya Christian Professionals Forum

5th Floor, New Waumini House,

Westlands,

P O Box t4945-oo8oo

NAIROBI.

Telz +25479t8or536.

Email: info.kcpf@gmail.com / info@kcpf.or.ke

July zozo



RECOMMENDATIONS TO THE NATIONAL ASSEMBLY

PART I:

"A Bill for AN ACT of Parliament to provide for the procedure of the approval of an

amendment to the Constitution by a referendum, the conduct of a referendum,

referendum petitions and for connected purposes."

INTRODUCTION

The Kenya Christian Professionals Forum (KCPF) is an organization that brings together Christian

Professionals and Faith Based lnstitutions with shared values in Life, Family, Religion and Covernance.

We provide technical support to various institutions that share in our values in the country and beyond
working on developing a society and culture that is based on biblical values. Our key partners include

the umbrella bodies like Kenya Conference of Catholic Bishops (KCCB); National Council of Churches

of Kenya (NCCK) and the EvangelicalAlliance of Kenya (EAK).

Constitutions in developing countries are thoroughly transformative documents by necessity; no

developing country wants to stay as it is.'We also have to remember that electoral regimes affect
democratic performance by influencing popular perceptions of the political process, by shaping the
party system and by determining the composition of governing organs.2 Thus, elections are an integral
part of democracies as instruments for delegation of authority from citizens to their representatives.
This is the route that the country has taken, and it must be respected.

Currently, before the National Assembly, there are two Proposed Referendum Bills. Our observation
of them indicates that there are few major differences between them. They are ideologically similar

and have proposed little less divergent constitutional amendment provisions in relation to the
Elections Act. lt is noteworthy to point out that they are not a duplicate of each other.

We have reviewed the two Bills and we seek to make our comments on the same;

1 C Sustein, DesigningDemocracy: What Constitutions Do, Oxford, Oxford University Press (zoor) p68
2 Walter Khobe OchienE, Journal of Low and Ethics: Vol. 3, Kabarak Law School (zor8) pz.

2



)

THE REFERENDUM BILL 2o2o AND THE REFERENDUM BILL (NO.2) zo2o

These are two Bills were introduced by Members of Parliament Hon. Jeremiah Kioni (Member of the

Constitutional lmplementation and Oversight Committee) as a private member's Bill and Hon. William

Cheptumo, who serves as the Chair of the Departmental Committee of Justice and Legal Affairs (JIAC)

herein referred to as the "Referendum Bill zozo and The Referendum Bill (No. z) of zozo" respectively.

The principal objects of the Bills are to provide for the procedure of the approval of an amendment to

the Constitution by way of a referendum, the conduct of a referendum, referendum petitions and

consequential amendments to the Elections Act, No. z4 of zott which currently provide for the conduct

of referendum procedures in Kenya.

The two Bills separately propound common amendments to the Elections Act number z4 of zot't,by

repealing some sections and amending some sections.

We are concerned by the qualities of accountability, professionalism and governance in these two Bills.

There are six (6) areas of divergence in the two Bills and the need to be harmonized or a common

ground established, and they are;

t Time frame for procedural processes;

2 Framing of referendum questions;

3 Annunciation of referendum results;

4 Security for costs in referendum petitions;

5 Multiple referendum questions; and

5 IEBC Voter registration, voter detail verification, voter details storage and back up.

PART II

SUMMARY OF ISSUES AND OUR RECOMMENDATIONS

The wording of the two Bills are inherently different in timeframes and procedural provisions in

relation to when one process has to start and when it should end, how long it should take and what

steps should the process go through.

Secondly, we have noted the difference as regards parallel referendum questions. One Bill provides

for the procedure in case of multiple referendum questions while the other is silent on the issue. We

appreciate the probability of a parallel referendum questions being fronted by the referendum

3



a

committees and thus, it will be our recommendation to have the position on the issue provided clearly

by the referendum Bill.

Thirdly, KCPF is concerned about the IEBC signature collection, verification and back-up processes as

concerns the referendum Bills. There is no set regulation published by IEBC on how they will verify

signatures collected for this purpose and other connected purposed.

Lastly, KCPF is concerned with the timing of the referendum. Developed economies combine their
referendum with general elections, for political and economic reasons. The economic aspect is to save

on the national budget and politically, to attain stability within the countries.

The two Bills have different positions as regard the issues. The table below provides a summary of
these issues;

THE REFERENDUM BILL zozo THE REFERENDUM BILL(NO.2) zozo

t Annunciatlon of poll results

Section z7 (r)
The Commission shall, on receipt of the results of
the referendum from all constituencies and
within forty eight (48) hours from close of the
final polling in the referendum;

a Announce to the public the total number
of valid votes cast, supporting or
opposing the referendum question

b Declare whether the amendment to the
constitution has been ratified by-:
i Ai least twenty percent (zo%) of

the registered voters in each of at
least half of the counties vote in
the referendum;

ii The amendment is supported by a
simple majority of the citizens
voting in the referendum;

c Publish a notice in the gazette indicating
the results of the referendum in each
constituency and;

d Publish ln the Cazette a certificate
declaring the results of the referendum
and confirming whether or not the
amendment to the constitution has been

Section 5(tt)
Upon conclusion of the referendum, the
chairperson of the Commission shall certify to the
president within seven (7) days of dectaration of
referendum results whether the Bill has been
approved in the referendum.

Section 5(rz)
The president shall within 3o days of approval of
the Bill assent to the Bill.

4



ratified ln accordance with the provisions
of the Act and the Constitution.

Dlscusslons on the part

The time factor, as to when should the official results of a referendum poll be released and published
to the public, is a great integrity issue. Delay of poll results have historically hinted at inconsistency in
the final result. Having a clear set out time frame to which such volatile information is conveyed to the
general public is the rubric of the entire poll process.

The Constitutional Amendment Bill, zozo, gives a way straightforward approach in relation to time
bound annunciation and publication of the poll results to the public, up to gazettement of the same
as final, to be finalized within 48 hours from receipt of the official results from all the constituencies.

On the other hand, The ConstitutionalAmendment Bill (No.z) zo2o does not provide for an ambitious
time frame to which poll results are to be announced and declared as final by the Commissioner
responsible. lt gives a rough timeline of seven (7) days, where within this time, the Chairperson of the
Commission should declare whether the referendum question was approved or not. Further, the
certification of the results of the poll, as per the Bill is to the President.

There is need to harmonize the timeframes provided by the two Bills to a reasonably effective time
frame. The competing inconsistencies on the two Bills, relating to the annunciation and gazettement
of the outcome of the polls should be brought back to a common ground, since the responsibility of
all such Processes and actions percolate back to the citizenry, who will be on the receiving end of the
effect of the parliamentary decision in this matter.

Recommendatlons

The competing inconsistencies on the two Bills, relating to the annunciation and gazettement of the
outcome of the polls should be harmonized and thus;
1, We recommend that the timeline for annunciation of referendum results should be not more than

48 hours since close of polling.

z Framing of the referendum question

Sectlon 6 (z)
The Commission shall withln seyen days of receipt
of the notice under subsection (r)r publish a
question to be determined during a referendum
in the Gazette and in electronic and print media of
national circulation.

Section 9.
8 Where the Commission -

receives a notification from the President
under Article zS6(SXa) of the Constitution
or

b a draft Billfrom the ofa lar

3 Section 6. (t) Of the Constitution A mendment Btll, zozo. The Commisslon shall conduct a referendum within
ninety days of receipt of a notice under Article 256(5) (a) and Article 257(ro) of the Constitution.

5



initiative under Article 257 of the Constitution,
The Commission shall, within twenty-one days,

frame the question or option to be determined
during the referendum.

Discussions on the part

The Constitutional Amendment Bill, zozo gives the Commission seven (7) days after receipt of notice
pursuant to Article 256 (5) or Article 257, within which they should frame the referendum question to
be determined during the referendum and gazette the same for public information and knowledge.

On the other hand, The ConstitutionalAmendment Bill(No. z) 2020 gives the Commission a time frame
of twenty-one (zr) days within which they should formulate the referendum question.

Recommendation

The parity in defining and coming up with a referendum question is a matter of diligence and pro-
activity in the wordings of the two Bills.

r. We recommend having the Commission define and come up with a suitable referendum question
within twenty-one (zr) days. This will be in contemplation of a possibility of a referendum question
review and approval by the relevant House of parliament, and the probability of parallel referendum
questions.

The timeline gives the Commission enough time to review the referendum question(s) before being
gazetted.

3 The procedure for a referendum question

Sectlon 6. (r)
The Commission shall conduct a referendum
within ninety days of receipt of a notice under
Article 256(5) (a) and Article 257(to) of the
Constitution.
(z) The Commission shall wlthin seven days of
receipt of the notice under subsection (l) publish
a question to be determined during a referendum
in the Gazette and in electronic and print media of
national circulation.

Section 9. (t)
Where the Commission -8 receives a notification from the President

under
Article 256(5)(a) of the Constitution or
(b) a draft Bill from the promoters of a popular
initiative under Article 257 of the Constitution, the
Commission shall, within twenty-one days, frame
the question or option to be determined during
the referendum.
(z) The Commission shall, within seven days after
framing the question or option, refer the question

or option to the relevant House for approval.
(3) lf the Parliament approves the question or
option submitted under subsection (z), the

1

6



Speakers of the two Houses shall jointly, within
seven days, notify the
Commission of the decision of the relevant House.

(8) Upon receiving the decision of the relevant
House approving the question or option, the
Commission shall, within seven days, publish the
question or option in the
Gazette and the electronic media and two
newspapers of national circulation.

Dlscussions on the part

The Constitutional Amendment Bill (No. 2) of 2o2o provides under Section 9, the procedure before
gazettement of the referendum question and publication to the public. lt provides for reference of
the referendum question to the relevant house of Parliament by the Commission, where the question
will either be approved or sent back to the Commission for review before being published in the
gazette. This is not sllent in The Constitution Amendment Bill, 2o2o.

There should be a harmony of processes between the two Bills. Whether the referendum question
should be reviewed and approved by the rilevant House of Parliament or will the Commission have
the final say on the referendum question. The best democratic practice would be to have the
referendum question reviewed by the relevant House before approval and publication on the Kenya
Gazette.

Further, Part 6(t)4 of the Bill provides for a go-Day time period within which the Commission should
conduct a referendum after receipt of Notice under Articles 256(5)(a) or Article t57(o) of the
ConstRution of Kenya zoro.

Recommendations

It is our recommendation that the go-Doy period is short and should be amended to reflect the
proposals we have put forth on the questions of;

Parallel referendum questlons - There is need to create time and resources to satisfy the
accurrence of concurrent referendum questions and the much-needed public participation.

Costs and budgeting lssues -The p rocess and hurdles of settlng aside funds and resources for
the referendum should be factored in alongside the public participation timelines provlded
under the two Bills. These are aimed at reducing the costs of the process and proper election
budgetlng.

ili Need to match the referendum with the next coming General Election.

I

4 The Referendum Bill, 2020.

7



We therefore propose that the timeline of 9o days anticipated by The Referendum Bill, zozo is

relatively too short to factor in the changes we have recommended and thus, at least r2-Month tlme
period from the time of receipt of a notice under Articles 256(5) (a) and 257(to) of the Constitution
would be sufficient, to align and adequately engage in public participation in any referendum.

The section should thus be amended from the current 9o-Days to at least tz Months period so as to
read asl

Section 6. (t) *
The Commission shall conduct a referendum at least Twelve Months since the day of receipt of a
notice under Article 256(5) (a) and Article zSZ(to) of the Constitution.

4 Parallel referendum questions

The Referendum Bill zozo(Kionis' Bill) does not
provide for parpllel referendum questions.

Sectlon 6
(t) A Bill to amend the Constitution relating to a
matter specified in Article 255(1) of the
Constitution shall be formulated in a participatory
and inclusive manner taking into consideration all
opinioni and recommendations.

(z) To the extent possible, all opinions and
recommendations that are not divergent shall be
contained in a single Bill.

(3) Where, in the case of an amendment to the
Constitution by popular lnltlative, there is a

divergent general suggestion; the promoters of
thot initiative shall formulate it into a separate
draftBill.

(4) where, lnthe case of an amendment to the
Constitution by parliamentory initiative, there is a
divergent draft Bill, Parliament shall consider all the
draftBills and
may-
(a) merge them into one draft Bill;
(b) approve one draft Bill and disapprove the
other; or
(c) approve all the draft Bills for submlssion to the
people in a referendum.
(5) Where more than one draft Bill is to be
submitted to the people in a referendum, each of
the draft Bills shall constitute an option with a

separate symbol and answer.

8



(6) A voter in a referendum may only vote for one
option.

Discussions on the part

The Referendum Blll No.z of zozo under section 6 (3), on the question of multiple referendum
questions, those being referendum Bills with divergent suggestions, is well provided for. The
Referendum Bill zozo does not anticipate nor envision such a situation of multiple referendum
questions happening and goes against the very principle in the Elections Act No. z4 of zott.: The
provisions of the Election Act No.24 of zorr under Section 5r(z) should be amended as proposed by
The Referendum Bill (No.z) of zozo.

With the inclusion of the section in the Referendum Bill(Noz) 2020, the spirit of democracy, value for
lntegrity and fair governance principles have been buttressed, to give voice to alternative thoughts
and to streamline the referendum processes, by disabling the proposed feature of one referendum
question per poll anticipated in the Kioni Bill.

Recommendatlons

t. lt is the position of KCPF that providing for parallel referendum questions in the Bill is timely and
much appreciated in the sense that it speaks to the conduct and inclusivity of the Referendum
processes with the Kenyan people.
2. lt is our proposal that parallel referendum questions be allowed sufficient time to be popularized,
whether sponsored through parliamentary approach or the public lnitiative approach (r n4illion
Signatures)

3. lf a Constitution Amendment Bill is published, such a Bill should be given at least 6 months and a

maximum of 9 months in the houses, to get other aspects of the amendment Bills to be dealt with and
within the time-span, have the Bill(s) sponsors collect signatures for it, get it approved by IEBC and get
it to go through Parliament or the county assemblies, as the case may be and finally have it gazetted
for referendum.

5 Securlty for costs

Section 35 (z)
A petitioner shall deposlt one mllllon shillings as
security for costs of a petition presented under
this Act, within ten days of presenting the
petition.

Section z4 (z)
A petitioner shall deposlt one million shillings as

security for costs of a petition presented under
this Act, within ten days of presenting the
petition.

5 Section 5r(z) ofthe Elections Act;
(z) Where there is more than one referendum question, persons intending to campaign for or against each
referendum question shall, on application to the Commission, form one national referendum committee each
and one committee each in every constituency for each referendum question.

9



(3) Where, a petitioner does not deposit security
for costs as required under this section after
presenting of a referendum petition, the
referendum petition shall be struck out.

$) Where, a petitioner does not deposit security
for costs as required under subsection (z), the
referendum petition shall be struck out.

Discussions on the part

The two Bills have the provision on the security for costs. The pillar for this proposal is to avoid
malicious petitions from parties who may want to abuse the High Courts'resources and processes of
hearing and determining the legality or verifiability of poll results in Kenya.

What the two Bills fail to appreciate is that democratic iustice should be readily available to any citizen.
Kenya being a middle-income economy portends of a situation where the most affected citizen with
no access to the One Million Kenya shillings within ten days of annunciation of results, cannot seek
redress from the court. lt only opens the doors of justice to the rich, who can afford the price of
seeking justice when it affects them and closes the same door to an ordinary citizen who is under
constant effect from the result of any such democratic process.

Recommendations

t. lt is our recommendation to have the referendum petition(s) open and free of costs to any Kenyan

citizen with reasonable grounds to petition against referendum results or conduct, while raising the
threshold to sustain such a petition. This will lock out malice and at the same time allow for justice to
be served across the social and economic divide in the country.
z. The Bills should propose higher thresholds of interest in the petition and evidence material to sustain
a petition against a referendum and remove the requirement on the security for costs.

6 Referendum Costs and timing.

Section r6.
(t) A referendum committee shall bear lts own
costs during the campaign period of the
referendum.

(z) The costs referred to in subsection (t) include
payment of the agents of the referendum
committee.

Section t3.
(t) Each referendum committee shall bear lts own
costs during its existence.
(z) Where public money is used to finance the
activities of referendum committees, it shall be
dlstributed equally among the registered
referendum committees.
$) The provisions of the Election Campaign
Financing Act, 2oi3 relating to formation of
referendum expenditure committees, regulation
of expenditure, contributions and donations and
resolution of disputes shall apply to financing of
referendums.

Dlscussions on the Part.

10



t

.,

Referendums, just like elections are expensive national processes, conducted by or on behalf of the
Kenyan People, to make Constitutional changes they believe in, through a democratic process. The
two Bills provide a contrasting referendum financing mechanism, that where each committee bears
its own costs and where, as provided in the Referendum Bill (No.z) 2o2o, that public funds can be used
to finance the entire process; and with that comes the burden to the government, to divide all such
allocated funds to the various committees equally.6

Referendums are a way to poll the voting public for their views on specific issues. They can be useful
tools for generating debate on an issue and determining the views of the public when they are unclear.
However, because democracy is not merely the rule of the maiority and typically includes many checks
and balances to limit the power of any individual, institution or instrument, referendums are often
considered advisory or limited to very specific issues.T

One solution to this is to require a super majority. ln that case a referendum is more like a stamp of
approval for something that already has widespread support and enhances democracy by introducing
an additional check on the actions of elected officials. This would go in line with bundling the
referendum question(s) with general elections in the country and will act as a cushion to the economic
dent as a result of the poll processes, a check of power and policies among the elected officials and
also answers the question; that the main issue today is not referendums but the information around
that referendum, that is: are you adequately informed to make a decision?.

Recommendations

Some of the most developed nations in the world choose to hold their referendums during National
Elections, to reduce the costs of the process and to make more use of the public concern on
constitutional matters with the aim of reducing political temperatures all-round the years. About half
of all US states add referendums to ballot papers during presidential and midterm elections, covering
all manner of social and economic policy.E

Finally, Matt qvortrup* says referendums are a good idea if deployed sparingly and on issues that are
of maior significance. "Referendums are a good idea if used as a people's veto," he says. "You need
to save people's civic reserves for when it really matters. But when it really matters people should be
allowed to have their say."e

t. We therefore recommend that referendum be held during national elections.

6 Section r3(z) of The Referendum Bill (No.z) zozo
7 Accessed on July 7th, 2o2o. https://politics.stackexchange.com/questions/3S63r/why-are-referendums-held-
are-they-not-inherently-anti-democratic? AStock Exchonge question-answer publication on Politics Beta, on
November 26rh, 2or8,
8 Accessed on July 7th, 2020. https://www.theguardian.com/news/zor9 lmarl'nlreferendums-who-holds-them-
why-and-are-they-always-a-dogs-Brexit
e Matt qvortrup, Referendums Around theWorld, The Continued Growth of Direct Democrocy, First Edition,
Palgrave Macmillan, a division of Macmillan Publishers Limited p 61.

11



I

7 IEBC Voter registration, Voter verification and timelines to parliament and the county
assemblies to consider Bills.

Recommendatlons

KCPF proposes that the following guidelines on IEBC voter processes should be considered.
t Giving a timeline to Parliament to consider the amendment Bills and either accept or reject

them before the next phase of a referendum Bill is reached upon.

2 Giving a timeline to Counties when they are required to consider the Constitutional

amendment Bills. The respective county assemblies should submit the county assemblies'

report on their considerations on the Bills sent to them for consideration to the Commission

within 9o days from the date of receipt and the Commission should in turn draft and come up

with a referendum question to be determined in a referendum.

3 IEBC should have a clear framework onl
i lnformation required from signatories to a referenduml
ii procedure for signature collection and verification of the signatures collected;
iii Storage and back-up of the signatures collected for the purposes of referendum; and
iv Open access to voter details as captured by the Bio metric or any technological means

the Commission employs to collect, store, verify and retrieve voter details.

t

PART III

CONCLUSION

Legislative clarity in the conduct of a referendum is a welcome move and the National Assembly is

playing its constitutional role in filing the lacuna that was there. From our review of the two Bills, it is
paramount that harmonization of them is the best option so that the house discusses an improved
version of the two Bills based on our recommendations set out herein.

12



I

!
A]

0a
o

no
Cz
o|.
o.rt
ao
mFz
ovt,

I.{8
l-ttcb

llt{E=
1=
Smtr=Z,A

TX8a
==
-:LJfzHti
o\JFtZF
=+5En3
:iHF
l-o+tT9drH

o

{
ET

nocznFI
e6
;=
o
m
7tz
o
7tt,

IF
lm
Ja
[a
IE
l-{
l<
lm

l=

lso
IB
lz
lo
lc
l=
lo
lz
l+l-
lm
Ls
lm
l'n
lmt,
Im
lz
lolc
l3
itD
IFlr
lz
le
h.,r

b
l1r
h.r
lo
lrv
lo

F
,E

F
-t



I

t

-tJo
noc)
e.
o.-{r
c|
o
o-f,
o-

oJ
f,o
<o
=oq<=.of.-T o'

o_tt

f,
6'
6-

A
o_tr
t+
Jo
no
J
r+
t
En
o
:l
o
-lr
7o
=

-oJ
n
f,o

o
o-(D
6'
J

!o
{oa
o+r
.+J
o
!o
o
!
6-
G'
oxo
a
a'o
o-
OJ.+
.+
Jo
J
OJt
of
oJ

6-
o
o,
:l
o-
t+
Jo

+ a> 5E €B Pf-lO-ra9 =P *
= ;':i q
n1+=: o?_ ed +5 Is *[ Ei :.0' 0'* Ha q
+ sa 5on:f6'
I a= .Dvm-.

6- o-5 :E. Pe -Y
Jo:itoq =s ='o a.A H€ s; Io ora XE- aP 56 +s ;J eg :l4JA+
=oxt,fDa<orH EE A$ B+ 3
CTr3OJA 1z 

=.5 3t ;q E.5 ;
F ='o) I
rJorr1=o =o Xr.J o-< Yo^rD=.. V < )F= gnx.Di1 a

+g t,1

^JTUg$ e
=c A'

== 
d.0'q ;

JN

PEo=
-r
J

3o
f,
r+(

I
E
wc
a
'+
=rI
6-

E
o,*
6'
J

rE +c=ooni^>g:rh"
-oE a+^.2
f; !.Ho!rr
axsuf=
xe=-vrm
dtnZoqtr-{
o, :O Ul
-.IJ+ogf
jl^
fu.+
3E-:@ =:5'5
oq<
3s
io+

=frod
Er{n
6t+

-.1 oJdi.nfYA
=.Dd.r
:ro
3ao:l<uloo
-O-XoJ
X'6'l.+er3r
.+{
Joa
9 (IJ

=5'o,'gqFg
8g:
oJo
&n
gd-
(^E

=doo
+.*oa
6- ;$

=.;oq o_
7l oJ

o o,)<(n

:9\n+\! t,i
-{<=E-{A-if,==oJo:tJo!.Yo-o=oo
s+qs {i s?+!U5J.'t^jy1:ni
*H i e r s tr g6;q+{"uo-qs.=E5i ?;
3f;fi;i q-qx
t,^30"S 5ii
; pE; il -'e^
E i;nfi q af
i; 

=; 
q ; H

:4 ii6' dEq j6;H *d
FE g T f g 

E

-ii.#=R-' 
!-<l

'E i;€ ++
-)i;7=vtfJ!fioigE+E €8
-E:hnt 6.<: E d.43 E n R BO=TrfrO
=o-:O-t$n Ao H

=;5a :
:l o-or I 6ia-t)

n;E: fl It''6U+ 6-Eef'd n
cr^^,Jo6'3.or5 =tAfr=C'Qo-=' Y,j' 

=' 
8- v\

=X; d'(U==5

e{ d 3Oaf,aoooo
tt\

r, lP,,co-or +, 6_rt-
=r d -2.6,t 5o- E o,r7ni.i=:C
;.n d

o
-t__+i

6',
OJ

g
.g
c+

d

N
p
o)

ga

o



o
OJ
truo
\o
1.'

oo
E
t
(D

\,l

o,

o
0,c
UIo
Vl

E(^
=o

6'J

o

)
.D

oJ_o 0J-
E E *'*aa.ril'<^-i'0Jio,n:-- = oo =.=alJ

ooq 3
! =.6'.+)V
o'"oJ-o f
AE-vtrf,
-f.o,e'9--
ae=.
lDa*
5E=
d(rt
_f o

e qE
lrrDo-o-
+r ,+ O,,I d;

C\,uvtaC
Qrci+o
)a
^nNJ.D

cL-.dq
n t-tof,
3o
-.1 h
=.*u.q
OrnAC
tn!:t :o
oJo

oa
c
5
o-
oa

*se'.tr<nt+aD

a;+6'- +
(, i.oJA =t+39+-_ -a
I"t 

=:o- 9. il'o iTi d.

E E.5
Hd-[ 6'€
g TE

a= al
90R

=-
d.s#OJ

a : E 6 +}xqg.xg oc,

* s * i 9go- ; 6- 
=.E

fr s iq q;
i a- otl,o Y X oY a

i - E ]E J
d l.q *E a
=:=.'-OJ:i'J=.)-tDrL,='^-.a

:l =.x:f o

$[a$1
Ei 91 6'p cj

d al, i 3
1D '+ o., :Jqsdld.

B O 0ga<Lf

{ B.A ErD-{
6t=
Q=' Y

(D

69 (+
o_" :f
'ooJorf,

*o
fr)
€orD.+
:1 J
fr

o"L )
=o,noo
CrD
)+t+a6'9tj
9o
AJ=
=aD

!
o
UI

o5
o

o
o,c
IAo
)
)
(D

E
=

+>
tua
1Oof,
do-(+oro
=.+!
f:I
Pi.uO-
rDoq

(v
1
d

o)
{
=6'

6'

p 3 6- +6- A r G
=^Or^-'v==vne3[EiE.'.+ a *, l!- t, +!6'.+O'"lfl,.OO
= ilt j'ro,9 il =
.-. = =.'1V u c rYnF'orlo=:lni

=.Y 4, 1=.o, o-n6':6F?q.e.
=s;13 

;P
alh=

H E'iP X qr+ni:lJ alo-xlo Ln
EetB sil

id ala O='
E il o< Y3
* or< P i
4 i *€ il q

al.+! n 
=.OJ\,lE6d€s=13.tnJ-tOJ::

^fr-_ 
fr==-tl6 o o,l ;+='o-OEag-.5d*-

*?d i: gE tH
t/1 O or' G ^E'6=i'+85'8

; =d * 5I of,A;'" 13.-
E = aE I e 9.
J =O >ar.oJ
ts#.4 3 * e a
R-i FEa'4-2€-i'iG-E
t d i q; E ?

-vi -)
=Ot+.+LEquddg6'

!
o.E,

o
UIo
o.

3
(D
J
o.
3
o)

* 5'd. Lqrot.rt
3 eE 

=s 4 +EqdPd
+'hJ

=.Da3=sa
lDnrO-

=G'ZaH 0.+P.*add8=
f,f,

Zc.'aor(Jegla-i'i o, J
=u 

(D

5 
=.=-.+-.:il:tt^<='

oq <=

1+3
s f ;

Ar+oo)
Jol
E: 6o ,.+

_J
de-r5'
6g

t)
do
:TQ
-)d_ B.
;'6-
+E6a
t'' B

-.,| o,
=, r+

fie
irao
3
3o
a
.D

vv
rD 0,

8f.
=oido
:,ct*
OJ .i'*Y
o:,

3
(D)
o.
3o)
0,t

CL

t

,

w

OJ

ga

o

F
UI
!
FI
o
'tl
l.'l
no
=
=mz
UI



a

ta
OJ
tr
U!o
@
a

11
o,coo
o\

ET

n
o,c
o
Ol
NJ

OJ

E d.E X F
q' 3-=[aio-5 dE

-i**6'oof

if $r
He 'iOEo3 -Y

o

o ('!

I $Bh'Pd8;
JIo-X
{ar

^_-!JnJ6X--ildri
b'6' gI f o
fOni
=.9 

a
tnE=(^a=
=.t+LY s3

I 'El
ot+
+
6'
:l
3
o.,

c,o
!ao
o
:lt+o
o-

1E:; ie
+5s8ff"
3E*++i
F r - $"? ,-dlia*

o<-n
E+9;$.+lD<-d.
^o(QO:_-.-r9oo.DJ3 d f d n
S0"sag
e9# 5 Qotso{,^ I.
& 3 d'r,?ora=
='*o,I q il'r€

ra+h^ 
; rD 

==o, 
NJ

o a O oJ vv
kHo-=i'>
* 3 r [€ E
-rE.):=O='

3 i dlq?q6t.!t
h-JJ
rD oi ='o
A1H*

= 
i.asf,Ja(J

-.n=-+:l loa orio T-
dg$$3:; do-Yxor i9 r.*f
3de3

4r[=o o- =.6d tsaa*i[:rh:i'a:.Dr+=:r--r o- J nUA
=o::fi4 o d

=.b ro^5
ffqd.eOori-.945rUl5Co=E

-Jh6ae-
+3 d
O='+
q4-

,q6 g

E=BrDt
af.+(Do.r=
O-:(D

oo
o
o

a
(!

+i++dfr tri
E nH 1+E i.+s
t3.E " e: +s a 

g
.* 6'+ 8 E 1E e-eq;; q aIi*u
nB;H+f*a;5 -=o =€d Itr9"+l of io

el E [-E:E
E., g *# gg

+ ; * g a 6--y >* h 3- 3 r:;3
q s $E s EE 3.
P P3^9 3E e8
rD 

= f vjJ. 
= 

14 O,EiiiA6YE
3 a 3e'{ 1 t
e g 3 qrg E'dE6ag 6-q=- o o_ {< i/i tto-= r^

='q d {.:
-rdsa+7il*i,IP;
IO+
IJ

(,
o
6-
do
Cg
g
oJc
o

/'l =oJ
l-
IJ
JO
a'(^n
o:l
-o-(,Efno.+
tr_O

oJoJnr+a
Hoâoro

f,:, o-Oo,
Ct+ ,+
E. B'

qo-!
ooJo
o^; 

='nt o
=Afo.t - ,n)o-rD x

oJ=gr o-
o9r

o

En
d.. ?orD

r€a4
E='
a
O\l

! o-!
0., o, oa.; g.
rD='
-Ofo^-
c*=r *g6 6-aa1r Fo+a+tt,+ 6'org 30-olAt+,/D ='a.DJ

-. 5'
9-,

n-o n =atI6 gs Ir3E+a
,'+JrD6O'oJ:A; I€ =ro h ql
-h.tlDgJ^J.+lD=n
JJ='o d!stg€ i *:o:.f
-fo-oxhlD
" doQ
h =:- Y

3€ 1l6-qe i.
ddlJlh
JJLAo o ui;

5
-g
OJ

oa
o



l

a

t
+a

,

gr

-o
A)

qa

rD

n
o.tc
UIo
o
o\

03
=€t(D

t

o

o

tr
tr
Vto

T; =.8I Xa ;il+3=1e'dgi*E
P d.B 5 vt

ct g

J
3'

FT0r0(D

nilc
tno
lvo

E4=-.tD 3
8'Eoo
-o-

Eo
3+t

OJ

EIid
a.a- g
JAtA

5EJ'D

Bt
!Jao

q8 d6
a:f )Fv:'o--i(Dco<
*3aino,cg
or J.J O
ilrd
3'es *
;' rd o-

/DT
ni ..r fr't J 

-Ao -
C
f nQ

^ V

=YE-*j=,+
==
='E'+9. 6' liX=o
o-tn (^
orf\< oJ
h:llJ

gO13 O aror >oxo+oc=
;E s q * i d
f s fl f;;"? 3

=s 
q a 5 s E0Q* o-c n o

X-o fr J 5 e EOY*Yroor!tr+.O:g:l!o
=Hra3EE

=3-orJ5'3[*iii
EEEIIf
ff fi df d;
f 0J c !!' = './its e + qts I

r) .+Tt NJ

3 B-dE
= -o:/#'m' f aq.f,R d3nIBqE e5
+-|OrB'el,
=or 

:J.

f, -. rrr niTrRo"*{ 
=.4ie:5 B-tv 1*C.lJsq iIo/D-

a +ffaJU-r-r.<h- i+6'-or5+:o +6'
a a + - + 
^ o ===(,\ii #o0q ov
T.ini8=
ts3_5pad
oE=1C;
<-JA^rY
. J V\ O_r-+ 

-- g.rD o =
=.9 

+l,,
=,,; dE
= =l, - O.,9-, Gi.A

.Ea S31
)qJJ

o- o. ni o. oqoJc:lE(^< n o_:l -odcini
oo356-*+< off
.+/D q) r+:th=':f+
o f -s o o

n ='oJ lt-o 0r sE >

3 ? g,H 

=' 
I f t d

-:rrii-ct':-t

;nlgaq[*f,
Ii13 F+sir
;'9 F E q 8"? {-d'e o dl.tr o

rfiSntBiEo'i;"* E oroq 9 -.ig 6948, E

*E * i fi 3t A-I.H5deHufr'HglnrE i ="<=o ok = ooq or

3 l-g;5 5

dlHqsE*
! = iIHE
i= ds 4 E

35s t; t
5''* ar .r 6" Frq o rt !l

1=*H+XdailA3"o I = 5'ag=l{;9
+l++6'=t=36'
=olJof,

= 
E 3E 3 f 4

a9H=g.E+rE ,? r?=tu(ia+f.
-J-b o 6 *o 4
q -A-*- lg*=*-o il1
ir E+ re*
g d{< - o 5 =
d ri; i; a

j1=
ttJ-.

= 3.-
dr" Y

d€ F3E*g[+
q: r
O-ol ++< a
fD 

=.r=oo
d ae
.+64j'- n.
qq q.?

Alt+<J*il'i='
-oa6(Dc i.i r--
tU-Jff=+9,
n i.fD n
=uni g.:tr5
!orDco,=gq=r _. G's
=5dct0=qflJafr

+nn
=:.coqxil
1-dH O-aD

o-
r i-<se +
.DJl

oJ(U
OC'<;+
6Q
o-
aolo:l
-\ O'
6- or
oJ-
oIgh
6' ,,
JJ'o

tr
E
:l
ol+
C'o



:,1.1, ',

'
hylJc/';tzrR

Ir'{TER-RELrGrous C ouN c rL 4lftxve

MEMORANDUM TO THE

CONSTITUTIONAL IMPLEMENTATION OVERSIGHT COA,IA/IITTEE

THE NATIONAL ASSEMBLY

ON

THE REFERENDUM BILL (NATIONAL ASSEMBLY BILL NO 11 OF ?0?:0l,

1 6TH JULY 2O2O

V



a a
I

a

Memorandum on The Referendum Bitt No. 1 1 of 2020

A. Preamble

The lnter-Religious CounciI of Kenya (IRCK) appreciates the opportunity to present
this memorandum making input on the Referendum Bitt No. 11 of 2020. This foltows
the pubtication of the cat[ for pubtic participation in line with Articte 118(1)(b) of
the Constitution of Kenya 2010.

B. Dialogue Reference Group

Estabtished in 1983 and registered as a society in 2005, the lnter-Retigious Council
of Kenya (IRCK) is a coalition of the main faith communities in Kenya that mobitizes
their joint efforts to address shared concerns through inter-faith diatogue and
cottaboration.

The lnter-Retigious CounciI of Kenya is constituted by the foltowing faith commuties:

The|RCK appreciates the devetopment and processing of the Referendum Bitt No 10

of 2020 since it provides a framework for effecting constitutional reforms that
require referenda. IRCK is pteased to present the fotlowing observations and
recommendations on the Referendum Bitt No 11 of 2020.



!l
,. l
)

I

C. SPECIFIC COMMENTS ON THE ERNDUM BILL NO. 11 OF 2O2O

From the foregoing, the lnter-Religious CounciI of Kenya requests that these proposat be

reconsidered urgentty before enactment of the [aw.

Clause Subject matter Proposal Rationale

2 Definition of
"referendum"

Expand as fottows:

Referendum is a direct and
universal vote in which an entire
electorate is invited to vote on a
proposed constitutionaI
amendment or any other matter
of national or county
importance.

The proposal is very
narrow. Referendums can
be hetd for issues other
than ConstitutionaI
Amendments

4(4) Verification of
signatures

Propose that the period for
verification of signatures be
shortened to thirty (30) days,

90 days is too [ong, and
onty serves to delay the
process unnecessarity. The
extra 60 days can be
attotted to civic
education.

5(7\ Threshotd for
passingof the bitt
in the County
Assembties

The draft bitl reads "The
threshotd for voting in aCounty
Assembly in respect of a draft
bitt shatt be a majority of the
members of the County
Assembty".

We propose the word
"threshotd for voting in a
County Assembty in respect of a
draft bitt" be deteted and be
reptaced with the words
"threshotd for passing of the
draft bitt in the County
Assembty".

Threshotd for voting can
be interpreted to mean

"those necessary to form
a quorum for a vote tobe
taken " and therefore does
not give ctarity to the
threshotd for passing of
the draft bitt.

2



DI
r

a
\

a

Clause Subject matter Proposal Rationale

6(2) Number of
questionsforthe
referendum.

Make provision for drafting of
more than one question.

This witt conform with
the current provisions of
section 50 of the Etections
Act. Referendums can be
conducted for various
reasons, and sometimes it
is necessary to have more
than one question.

6(21 Number of days
for pubtishing the
question(s).

We propose that the words "for
seven consecutive days" be
inserted immediately after the
words "of nationat circutation"

This is to give more
peopte adequate
opportunity to access the
information.

6(3) Determination of
symbots.

Add the word "in consuttation
with the proposers and
opposers" after the words "The
Commission may...."

This is to ensure the
acceptabitityof the
symbots used to atl
groupings of the
populace.

7(s) YES and NO

answer.
We propose that the Act makes
provisions for the possibitity of
mutti-choice answers.

Referendums that are
dichotomous / binary in
nature are usualty
probtematic, depending
on the issues. lt boxes the
etectorate into two
distinct camps of
supporters and opposers.
This has a liketihood of
fanning conflict and
promoting discontent.
This catts for referendums
that give voters several
acceptabte options

8 Returning &
Presiding Officers

Make provision that the lead
officer and their deputy shatt be
of opposite gender.

This is to satisfy the
principtes of gender
equatity as enshrined in
the Constitution. (Articte
27)

I

3



a
I

, {

rr
Clause Subject matter Proposal Rationale

11(2) Voter
ldentification

Amend to inctude Biometric
Voter ldentification

This is in line with the
Elections Act and
accepted practice.

18(1 ) Agents Detete the word "area" and
reptace with the word "station"

Potting areas have severaI
potting stations and it is
not feasibte to have two
agents in an entire potting
area.

22 Language Provide for transtation into
dominant ethnic tanguage across
the Counties / Constituencies.

Provide for Braitte and audio to
be achieved progressivety

This compties with
provisions ofArticte
7(3Xb) and Articte
54(1Xd) of the
Constitution

23 Voting under
special
circumstances

Detete this section It can be used for mischief
and to rig an etection, as

monitoring peopte in
hospitats and sanatoria or
those leading nomadic
tives wilI bedifficutt.

26 Transmission of
results

Provide that resutts may be
transmitted etectronicalty.

This is to ensure speedy
and timeous transmission
of resutts, especiatty from
remote locations.

26(2\ Resutts Detete and provide for
[ivestreaming of resutts as they
are received from the
constituencies for pubtic
knowtedge.

This conforms to
ConstitutionaI right to
lnformation and is similar
to provisions of found in
section 39 of the Etections
Act.

Further, hotding the
results from constituencies
provides grounds for
suspicion of mischief on
the part of the
Commission.

4



t ),1
tr' r

r\

Clause Subject matter Proposal Rationale

3s(2)(3
) e (4).

Security for costs

of a petition
Detete these provision. Settin g a requi rement for

security for costs of a
petition, is a barrier to
access to justice and
therefore
unconstitutionat.

38(1Xb) Hearings in open
court

Amend to inctude virtual
hearings.

The Covid-19 pandemic
has introduced virtuaI
hearings as the new
normat in Kenya. lt atso
speeds up hearings and
reduces costs for the
petitioners.

38(3) Witnesses Detete provisions requiring
witnesses to tender evidence
that incriminates them.

This provision is
unconstitutionat. One
cannot be forced to give
setf -incriminating
evidence. Articte 50
provides adequate
protections and gives one
the right to refuse to give
setf-incriminating
evidence.

The proposed certificate
of indemnity is atso
ittegat. Why shoutd the
[aw shietd a criminal?

41(3) A
(4)

Transmission of
judgment and
certificate of
conctusion of
petition by
registrar of the
High Court.

The Bitt shoutd provide a

timetine within which the
Registrar is to transmit the
certified copy any decisions
made by the High Court aswetl
as the certificate at the
conctusion of the proceedings.

We propose a timetine of not
more than 3 days.

This witt enhance
efficiency and avoid
unnecessary detays.

i
t-

I

t

5



fr r.
U
v'

a

t )

t

Clause Subject matter Proposal Rationale

42 Costs fottowing
the petition.

We propose the inctusion of a
rider that the costs should not be
punitive, and in any event
shoutd not exceed Kenya
Shittings Five Hundred
Thousand. (Kshs. 500,000/-)

Etection petition costs
have been very punitive
in the past, to the extent
that it becomes a
deterrent. There is need

to contro[ the amounts
awardable. The high costs
awarded have become a

barrier to access to justice.

43 Voting by persons

with speciaI
needs.

This seems misptaced, it shoutd
be moved to the part of the Act
that deats with voting.

It improves the ftow and
structure of theAct.

45 Regutations We propose that the Bitt
provides timetines for enacting
regutations.

It woutd be unfortunate
to have a referendum in
the absence of
regutations. Trends
confirm that regutations
usuatty take far too long
to be enacted. Timetines
woutd institt a sense of
urgency and cure such

detay.

s(d)
Code of
Conduc
t

Campaigning in
Churches and
funerals

It should be ctarified that
retigious teaders may address
their ftock on the issues in the
referendum, and that such
addresses wit[ not amount to an

infraction of the Code.

The putpit is aretigious
leader's domain, and the
main ptace for addressing
their members on matters
of import in their lives
inctuding such as would
be addressed through a

referendum.

10 Code
of
Conduc
t

Peace
Committees.

This is a good inctusionhowever
it shoutd be provided for in the
Act, which shatt ctarify the
composition and powers of the
peace committees.

It is a substantive
provision, and needsto
draw vatidity from the
statute itsetf, and not
derive its origin in the
Code.

6



"$t
{r

' .t 
t,

dl

$
!.

t'll'

Feedback or request for additionat information regarding this memorandum may be
channeled to the IRCK Executive Director Dr. Francls Kuria through
fkurla@i nterreligiouscouncl l. or. ke

Signed

For lnter-Religious Council of Kenya

Rev. Fr. Joseph Mutie

Chalrman

IRCK Executive Committee

L.\

T

',/ \

T

.].
'lF

/


